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VKEMA

400 Renaissance Center = Detroit, Ml 48243 - EIN# 38-1446628

PETER S. VOGEL, RECEIVER
THANKSGIVE TOWER, SUITE 3000
1601 ELM STREET

DALLAS, TX 75201

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

RE: BARON RECEIVERSHIP MATTERS

DALLAS\509827.2

DUE UPON RECEIPT
MARCH 28, 2013

CLIENT-MATTER NO. 108946-0001
INVOICE NO. 1506461

$ 145,305.00

1,257.09

............................. $_146,562.09
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KEMA

PETER S. VOGEL, RECEIVER CLIENT-MATTER NO. 108946-0001
MARCH 28, 2013 INVOICE NO. 1506461
PAGE NO. 2

RE: BARON RECEIVERSHIP MATTERS

DATE ID DESCRIPTION

12/31/12 CDKR  WORK ON W/ DJS. (3.5) WORK ON
FEE APPLICATIONS FOR RECEIVER AND HIS COUNSEL(NC), INCLUDING FILING
OF SAME. (NC) RECEIVED AND REVIEWED ORDER CONCERNING STATUS OF
MANDATE FROM FIFTH CIRCUIT, AND DISTRIBUTED SAME. (.5) DRAFTING OF
RESPONSE TO OBJECTIONS FILED BY BARON IN THE DISTRICT COURT.
RECEIVED AND REVIEWED BARON’S MOTION TO DISQUALIFY JUDGE
FURGESON, AND DRAFTED RESPONSE TO SAME. (1.0). STRATEGY CALL WITH
MR. SCHENCK AND MR. VOGEL. FOLLOW-UP CONFERENCE WITH MR.
SCHENCK (NC).

12/31/12 DISCH DRAFTING AND FILING FEE STATEMENT THROUGH P. VOGEL. (1.0) DRAFTING

PETITION FOR S ¢ .5 )

01/01/13 CDKR  DRAFTING OF MOTION FOR
VERSION. CONFERENCE CALL WITH COUNSEL FOR TRUSTEE. FOLLOW-UP
CONFERENCE CALL WITH MR. SCHENCK.

DRAFTING EDITING AND REVIEW OF MOTION FOR
(8.0) FILING AND SERVICE OF MOTION FOR
.5) DRAFTING OF MOTION TO

1.) FILING AND SERVICE OF SAME. STRATEGY
CONFERENCE WITH MR. SCHENCK..( NC)

01/02/13 CDKR

01/02/13 DJSCH NEGOTIATION W/ TRUSTEE RE:

.5), DRAFT SAME AND CONFER (1.0) DRAFT RESPONSE TO
; CIRCULATE AND FILE SAME (1.0). DRAFT AND HEAVILY
REVISE AND CIRCULATE (5.5) SHORTEN TO FIT TO PAGE
LENGTH, (2,5), MOTION TO EXCEED LENGTH REVIEW AND EDIT CDK DRAFT
(.5), CONFERENCES ON SAME (NC), FILE AND DRAFT AND FILE ADVISORY TO
DISTRICT COURT (.5). CONFERENCES RE:

R (NC).

01/02/13 JRF  REVIEW AND COMMENT UPON PETITION FOR S\ ND OTHER
RELATED BARON AND TRUSTEE MOTIONS (.7).

01/03/13 ALP  DRAFTED RECEIVER'S INVENTORY OF ASSETS AS OF 1/3/13 AS WELL AS
REDACTED VERSION (1.7); OFFICE CONFERENCES WITH JEFF FINE REGARDING
SAME (.3).

01/03/13 CDKR  REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF MOTIONS FOR REHEARING FILED BY BARON AND
NOVO POINT IN THE FIFTH CIRCUIT. (1.5) STRATEGY CONFERENCE WITH MR.
SCHENCK AND MR. FINE. (NC) DRAFTING, EDITING AND CIRCULATION OF

AND MOTION 10 {
FILING AND SERVICE OF SAME. (5.0)

HOURS
5.00

7.50

2.70

9.50

11.50

0.70

2.00

6.50
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Dykeva

PETER S. VOGEL, RECEIVER CLIENT-MATTER NO. 108946-0001
MARCH 28, 2013 INVOICE NO. 1506461

PAGE NO. 3
DATE ID  DESCRIPTION HOURS
01/03/13 DISCH CALLS TO AND FROM FIFTH CIRCUIT CLERK RE: PETITION AND TREATMENT 7.00

AS PANEL REQUEST,(.5) CONFER AND DRAFT EMAIL W/ COCHELL RE:
WITHDRAWAL OF DEMANDS TO DOMAIN HOLDINGS GROUP AND FABULOUS,
(1.0) OUTLINE AND BEGIN DRAFTING Uy 11 1NG, (3.0)
FEE ORDER FROM COURT, REVIEW AND FORWARD SAME AND BRIEF CALLS
AND TEAM MEETING RE: SAME (1.0), , RE-RUN AND PROOF PRIOR FEE AND
EXPENSES, (.5) LETTER TO COURT. (1.0)

01/03/13 JRF  REVIEW ORDERS AND VARIOUS LATEST MATTERS ENTERED BY JUDGE 4.10
FURGESON AND OTHERS WITH DAVID SCHENCK AND CHRIS KRATOVIL AND
MS. PARNELL (1.0). LATER CALL WITH PETER VOGEL REGARDING Jmy
@ (). PREPARE RECONCILIATION OF DYKEMA FEES (4). PREPARE DRAFT
OF RECEIVER'S INVENTORY (1.4). CONFER REGARDING RESPONDING TO
OTHER REQUESTS FROM THE COURT (.7).

DRAFTING, EDITING AND CIRCULATION OF MOTION FOR il iy 5.00

TR NS SEE \ [) \1 (1 ON 10
RN DR AFTING OF PROPOSED
ORDER GRANTING st o (- .0)
FILING AND SERVICE OF SAME. (.3) REVIEW OF NUMEROUS ORDER ISSUED BY
THE DISTRICT COURT. (.7) STRATEGY CONFERENCE WITH MR. SCHENCK (NC),

01/04/13 CDKR

01/04/13 DJSCH FURTHER CONFERENCES ON DOMAIN HOLDINGS W/ COCHELL (.5) AND 5.50
FORWARDED SAME, REVISE AND FILE REQUEST FOR ORDER AND TO SHOW
AND MEETINGS WITH MR. KRATOVIL, MR. FINE AND CALL MR. VOGEL RE
SAME, CAUSE, ETC., (2.5) FILINGS BY BARON FORMER COUNSEL/BANKRUPTCY
CLAIMANTS RECEIVED & REVIEWED (1.5), ORDERS FROM COURT REVIEWED &
FORWARDED (.5), CALLS WITH PETER VOGEL RE;

FREl (.5)

01/04/13 JRF  VERY EXTENDED TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH RAY URBANIK REGARDING 3.50
AN .8). PREPARE AND FILE RECEIVER'S
INVENTORY PRIOR TO NOON DE = (1.3). CONFER WITH DAVID SCHENCK
AND PETER VOGEL REGARDING STRATEGY FOR DEALING WITH

1.0). REVIEW VARIOUS ORDERS
ISSUED BY JUDGE FURGESON AS ACTION ITEMS (4).

01/07/13 CDKR  STRATEGY CONFERENCE CALL WITH MR. SCHENCK. (NC) REVIEW AND 1.50
ANALYSIS OF NUMEROUS ORDERS ISSUED BY DISTRICT COURT. (.8) REVIEW
OF FILINGS IN BANKRUPTCY COURT. (.3) RESPONSE TO QUESTIONS FROM MR,
VOGEL. (.2) REVIEW OF NUMEROUS E-MAILS TO & FROM VOGEL AND OTHERS
RE: RECENT ORDERS. (.3)
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PETER S. VOGEL, RECEIVER CLIENT-MATTER NO. 108946-0001
MARCH 28, 2013 INVOICE NO. 1506461
PAGE NO. 4

DATE 1D DESCRIPTION HOURS

FOLLOW UP CALL W/ PETER AND TEAM RE: SAME
AND STATUS ISSUES, (1.5) ORDERS FROM COURT RE: CONTEMPT, FEES AND
OTHER ISSUES REVIEWED AND FORWARDED, (.5) MEETING WITH JEFF FINE
AND CALLS & EMAILS WITH PETER RE:

01/07/13 DISCH EMAILS AND CALL W/ PETER VOGEL RE: 5.00

IR S =L ND SUBSEQUENTLY
REVIEW SAME, (1.5) MEETING W/ J. FINE RE: : :
T 'ALL TO PETER RE: SSSMK.5) AND DRAFTING EMAIL

TO BARON’S PUTATIVE COUNSEL RE: SAME (.5).

01/07/13 JRF  EMAILS, CALLS WITH PETER VOGEL REGARDING Sy 7.00
.5). LATER MULTIPLE CALLS WITH PETER VOGEL

FOLLOWING UP ON STATUS OF VARIETY OF RECEIVERSHIP ISSUES (.9).
ANALYZE AND EMAIL RE ORDERS FROM COURT REGARDING FEES,
CONTEMPT AND OTHER ISSUES (.5). MEETINGS WITH DAVID SCHENCK (1.1),
CALLS WITH PETER VOGEL REGARDING
CONFERENCES RNy 6) . VERY EXTENDED TELEPHONE
CALLS FROM POTENTIAL BARON NEW COUNSEL SEEKING $100,000 RETAINER
(1.4). EMAILS AND RESPONSES RE SAME. CALLS WITH PETER VOGEL RE SAME

(.6).

01/08/13 CDKR STRATEGY CONFERENCE CALL WITH MR. SCHENCK AND MR. FINE. (NC) 1.00
REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF NUMEROUS ORDERS ISSUED BY DISTRICT COURT
(.4). REVIEW OF FILINGS IN BANKRUPTCY COURT. (.3) REVIEW OF NUMEROUS
E-MAILS. (.4)

4),

01/08/13 DJSCH REVIEW LETTER FROM CLIENT, (.8) MEET WITH J. FINE (1.8), RESEARCH RE: 8.2
I AND MOTION IN BANKRUPTCY COURT., (1.7) CALLS AND
MESSAGES TO (il (3) FURTHER ORDER FROM JUDGE FURGESON
RECEIVED, AND FORWARDED (.2), AND FURTHER CALLS AND MESSAGE TO
) (.2) DETAILED EMAIL ANSWER TO ISSUES FROM LETTER AND
POTENTIAL Y (1.0) DRAFTING MOTION AND FORWARD SAME
(1.5) CALL W/ PETER VOGEL AND JRF (.5), FOLLOW UP EMAIL AND FORWARD
LATEST DRAFT OF MOTION. (.2)

01/08/13 JRF  REVIEW LETTER FROM G NN 4). MEETINGS WITH DAVID SCHENCK 7.00
RE (R <) (NC). RESEARCH AND ANALYZE

(2.5), AND .3) REVISE il
.5). VERY EXTENDED TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH Sllliiie

- R S). REVIEW AND
DRAFT EMAILS RE SAME (.3). VERY EXTENDED TELEPHONE CONFERENCES
wiTH R - HIS BEING ASKED TO BE NEW BARON COUNSEL (.8).
DRAFT MOTION PAPERS FOR PETER VOGEL(.6). .

01/08/13 ~ MCWAN RESEARCH REGARDING il 1.40

01/09/13 CDKR  REVIEW OF ORDERS ISSUED BY DISTRICT AND BANKRUPTCY COURTS. (.4) 0.60
REVIEW OF NUMEROUS E-MAILS. (.2) CALL WITH MR. SCHENCK. (NC)
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DyKema

PETER S. VOGEL, RECEIVER CLIENT-MATTER NO. 108946-0001
MARCH 28, 2013 INVOICE NO. 1506461

PAGE NO. 5
DATE ID DESCRIPTION HOURS

01/09/13 DJSCH MEETING W/ J. FINE RE: .5) 5.10
DRAFTING FROM 3 (2.5) INITIAL OUTLINE OF

ND FORWARD SAME PER CALL WITH MR. FINE (1.5); CALLS FROM
FIFTH CIRCUIT RE: PANEL OR EN BANC OR BOTH, (.2) PAPERS COPIES OF BRIEF
PREPARED AND FORWARDED PER CLERK (.2); ORDERS FROM DISTRICT COURT
RE: RENEWALS AND BANKRUPTCY REVIEWED AND FORWARDED (.2).

01/09/13 JRF  MEETINGS WITH DAVID SCHENCK. RE WilNEGGGGGaasmny) DR ArT Wiy 6.70
AND
MOTION .(4.0) REVIEW BANKRUPTCY COURT REPORT TO DISTRICT COURT
AND CONFER WITH DAVID SCHENCK RE SAME (7). ORDERS FROM COURT RE
DOMAIN NAME RENEWALS. TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH DAMON
NELSON RE {SE® (1.0). ANALYZE SAME (.5).

RE: COURT/ OTHERS/, 5.50
.5), LENGTHY MEETING WITH

01/10/13 DJSCH RESEARCH ON
BARON, (2.0) RESPONSE. F. ,
PETER VOGEL, J. FINE AND DAMON NELSON RE: :

(1.5), WITH VOGEL & FINE RE: ONGOING

- S

(.5), REPORT FROM BANKRUPTCY

COURT AND JUDGE FURGESON ORDER ADOPTING SAME. (1.0)

01/10/13 JRF  TELEPHONE CALL REGARDING St e, ). 0.60

01/10/13 JRF OR MEETING WITH PETER VOGEL (2.0). ATTEND 8.10
MEETINGS WITH DAMON NELSON, PETER VOGEL AND DAVID SCHENCK RE
SRR | 5). THEN MEETINGS WITH PETER VOGEL AND MR. SCHENCK RE

WD | ST RS SN )

D DISCUSS ONGOING TG

(.5). REVIEW REPORT FROM JUDGE

FURGESON AND HOW HE ADOPTED SAME (.5). RESEARCH AND FURTHER

DRAFTING OF AND Tl

(3.1).

ANALYZE

01/11/13 CDKR STRATEGY CONFERENCE CALL WITH DAVID SCHENCK AND JEFF FINE. (NC) 1.10
REVIEW OF E-MAILS FROM THE RECEIVER. (.1) REVIEW OF ORDERS ENTERED

BY DISTRICT COURT. (.2) WORK ON (e
T ()

or1113  pisci  MULTIPLE S e -\ 3.70

(2.0) EMAILS TO & FROM PETER RE:
ND RESPONSE, RESPONSE AND REPLY FROM SR (2)
(NC) J. FINE DRAFT RESPONSE, COMMENT ON SAME AND MEET WITH MR.
FINE, P. VOGEL AND MR. KRATOVIL (.5) (NC), REVIEW FURTHER Sy

(.5) FURTHER OUTLINING/DRAFTING MOTION TO il
(.5)
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Dykema

PETER S. VOGEL, RECEIVER CLIENT-MATTER NO. 108946-0001
MARCH 28, 2013 INVOICE NO. 1506461
PAGE NO. 6
DATE ID  DESCRIPTION HOURS
01/11/13 JRE  RESEARCH POTENTIAL (S / ND DRAFT NOTICE 6.00
RE T ) S (2.5). REVIEW.

MEETINGS WITH DAVID SCHENCK AND MR. KRATOVIL RE ISSUES RAISED BY
DISTRICT COURT ADOPTION OF BANKRUPTCY REPORT (.5). RESEARCH AND
ANALYZE VARIOUS : AT DA T AN AT
AND EMAIL RESULTS TO TEAM (3.0).

01/11/13 RMT REVIEW ADVISORY ORDER ON RECEIVERSHIP EXPENSES; EXAMINE 3.10
CORRESPONDENCE FROM RECEIVER RE B
BEGIN DRAFTING RESPONSE TO ADVISORY ORDER.

01/12/13 ALP RESEARCHED FOR 9/27/12 HEARING TRANSCRIPT AT REQUEST OF DAVID 0.70
SCHENCK AND PETER VOGEL (.5); DRAFTED AND RESPONDED TO SEVERAL E-
MAILS WITH DAVID SCHENCK AND JEFF FINE REGARDING SAME (.2).

01/12/13  DISCH MOTION TO [ M ATLS RE: SAME AND ORDERS, AND 2.50
01/12/13 RMT  CONTINUE DRAFTING RESPONSE TO (e 2.20
01113/13  DISCH REVIEW DRAFT FROM ROSA, COMMENT ON SAME, EDITING, 3.00
01/13/13 JRF DRAFT AND FORWARD TO RECEIVER ALTERNATIVE (i 3.00

(2.0). RESEARCH AND ATTENTION TO OTHER
OUTSTANDING PLEADINGS REQUESTED BY PETER VOGEL (1.0).

01/13/13 RMT  COMPLETE DRAFTING (. - A TING TO 3.10
RESPONSE TO ADVISORY; REVISE BRIEF.
01/14/13 CDKR DRAFTING, EDITING AND REVISION OF RESPONSE BRIEF IN OPPOSITION TO 2.20

THE DISTRICT COURT’S ADVISORY REGARDING CUTTING THE RECEIVER’S
FEES BY 50%. (2.0) REVIEW OF MULTIPLE E-MAILS FROM THE RECEIVER (.2).
CASE STRATEGY CONFERENCE WITH JEFF FINE. (NC)

01/14/13  DISCH HREVISED PER JEF AND CLIENT, (1.7), CALL 3.50
TATT MORRIS RE; , (3) RESEARCH FOR (i

WS (1.0) AND CALLS AND EMAILS RE: DRAFT OF SAME. (.5)
01/14/13 JRFE  EXTENDED RESEARCH AND ANALYSIS OF RECEIVER POSITION RE (N 6.80

} IN LIGHT OF JUDGE FURGESON
JANUARY 10 ORDER AND SUBSEQUENT ORDERS (3.8). EXTENDED
CONFERENCES WITH THE RECEIVER REGARDING SAME (1.1). REVIEW ALL
PLEADINGS FILED IN BARON CASE AND ANALYZE SAME FOR RECEIVER AND
STATUS HEARING ON 1/16 (1.9). CASE STRATEGY CONFERENCES WITH CHRIS

KRATOVIL (NC).

01/15/13 CDKR  PRIMARY DRAFTING, EDITING AND REVISION OF (i 5.00
DISTRICT COURT'S ADVISORY REGARDING REDUCTION OF RECEIVER'S FEES.
(4.5) REVIEW MR. FINE'S PROPOSED
(.5) REVIEW OF ORDERS ISSUED BY DISTRICT COURT. (NC) IN-PERSON
CONFERENCE WITH MR. VOGEL, MR. FINE AND MR. SCHENCK TO PREPARE
FOR HEARING BEFORE BANKRUPTCY COURT. (NC)
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PETER S. VOGEL, RECEIVER CLIENT-MATTER NO. 108946-0001
MARCH 28, 2013 INVOICE NO. 1506461

PAGE NO. 7
DATE ID  DESCRIPTION HOURS

01/15/13 DJSCH REVISE MOTION TO NP > 5) CALLS RE: SAME AND 7.00
RECORD SEARCH FOR Sl (| 5) LENGTHY
MEETING WITH PETER AND TEAM AT GARDERE OFFICES RE: TOMORROW’S
HEARING, il
JRERSREy 11 NG BY TRUSTEE RE: WIND-DOWN, (2.5) FILE RECEIVER RESPONSE
TO COURT’S PROPOSED WIND-DOWN PER P. VOGEL. (.5)

01/15/13 JRF EXTENDED STRATEGY CONFERENCES WITH DAVID SCHENCK AND CHRIS 5.50
KRATOVIL (NC). ANALYZE LATEST ORDERS FROM DISTRICT COURT,
RESPONSES TO SAME BY VARIOUS PARTIES, EMERGENCY MOTION FOR
BARON RETAINER, REQUESTS FROM RECEIVER REGARDING RESPONSES TO
COURTS (1.5). MEETING WITH RECEIVER AT RECEIVER'S OFFICE PREPARING
FOR 11/16/13 HEARING IN BANKRUPTCY COURT (2.5). PREPARE AND FILE
PLEADING IN DISTRICT AND BANKRUPTCY COURT RE WIND DOWN PLAN (1.0)

. EDIT RESPONSE TO (i 5).

01/15/13 RMT  REVIEW EARLIER RECERIVER ORDERS TO CONFIRM [, O 0.70
SUPPORT RESPONSE TO ADVISORY ON FEES.

01/16/13 CDKR PRIMARY DRAFTING, EDITING AND REVISION OF ol [N REQUEST TO 3.5

DISTRICT COURT’S JANUARY ADVISORY REGARDING REDUCTION OF
RECEIVER'’S FEES. (3.5) CONFERENCE WITH MR. FINE AND MR. SCHENCK TO
PREPARE FOR HEARING BEFORE BANKRUPTCY COURT, AS WELL AS TO
DISCUSS CASE STATUS AND STRATEGY (NC).

01/16/13 DJSCH MEETING W/ I. FINE RE: TRIAL AND BANKRUPTCY, ORDERS, (.5) AND CALLS 1.00
AND EMAIL W/ MATT MORRIS RE: (. .5)
01/16/13 JRF  PREPARE FOR HEARING ON JEFF BARON'S INVOLUNTARY (1.0). ATTEND ALL 7.60

AFTERNOON HEARING (3.0). CONFERENCES WITH PETER VOGEL & DJS BOTH
BEFORE AND AFTER HEARING (1.0). DRAFT ORDER ARISING OUT OF HEARING
AND CIRCULATE SAME TO ALL PARTIES (2.6).

01/17/13 CDKR REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF FLURRY OF ORDERS ENTERED BY BANKRUPTCY 1.00
COURT IN THE INVOLUNTARY BANKRUPTCY PROCEEDINGS. (.7) REVIEW OF
RELATED E-MAILS. (.3) CONFERENCE WITH MR. SCHENCK AND MR. FINE
REGARDING SAME (NC)

01/17/13 DJSCH ORDERS RE: TRIAL AND HEARING, WITHDRAWAL OF REFERENCE, (.5) 1.30

MEETING W/ JEFF FINE RE: (il ). EM AL
TO P. VOGEL RE: BILLS AND STAFF. (.5).

01/17/13 JRF  COLLATE MULTIPLE CONFLICTING COMMENTS TO 1/16 COURT ORDER (1.0). 3.70
EXTENDED CONFERENCE WITH RICHARD HUNT RE ORDER (.4). REDRAFT
B (S ). FINALIZE SAME AND MULTIPLE EMAILS TO
VARIOUS PARTIES AND COURT FORWARDING FINAL VERSION OF ORDER (.9) .
REVIEW ORDERS FROM DISTRICT COURT AND CONFERENCE REGARDING
IMPLICATIONS OF SAME W/DJS (.3). RETURN INQUIRY CALL TO S

e )
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Dykema

PETER S. VOGEL, RECEIVER CLIENT-MATTER NO. 108946-0001
MARCH 28, 2013 INVOICE NO. 1506461

PAGE NO. 8
DATE ID  DESCRIPTION HOURS
01/18/13 CDKR  REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF VARIOUS ORDERS ENTERED BY BANKRUPTCY 0.70

COURT IN THE INVOLUNTARY BANKRUPTCY PROCEEDINGS. (.5) CONFERENCE
WITH MR. SCHENCK AND MR. FINE REGARDING CASE STATUS AND STRATEGY
(NC). REVIEW OF RELATED E-MAILS (.2).

01/18/13 DISCH EMAILS AND MEETING W/ J. FINE RE: g 1.00

SRR  5) AND MEET WITH TEAM RE: SAME. (.5)

01/18/13 JRFE  REVIEW AND FORWARD (2). 1.20
EXTENDED TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH
REGARDING THE STATUS OF THE BARON BANKRUPTCY AND JOINT PLAN (.3).
EXTENDED CONFERENCE WITH DAMON NELSON RE SAME AND WHAT TO
EXPECT IN COMING WEEKS (.4). EMAILS TO BOTH WITH ORDERS (.2).
RESPOND TO EMAIL TRAFFIC (.1). STRATEGY DISCUSSIONS WITH DAVID
SCHENCK (NC).

01/21/13 DJSCH DOMAIN NAME/UDRP CORRESPONDENCE. 0.50

01/21/13 JRF WORK ON (i s). 0.50

01/22/13 DJSCH CONFERRING W/ J. FINE RE: SECTION 0.50
PER LAST WEEK’S MEETING WITH P. VOGEL (.3) , BARON’S NEW BANKRUPTCY

COUNSEL RE: RETAINER. (.2)

01/22/13 JRF ATTENTION TO $25,000 RETAINER TO MARK STROMBERG (.3). BEGIN 2.00
ADDRESSING WHAT APPEARS

1.2). RESEARCH AND MEET BRIEFLY

WITH MR. SCHENCK RE SAME (.5).

01/23/13 DISCH MEETINGS W/J. FINE RE: DRAFT A 2.00
DRAFTING OF SAME (1.2) AND CORRESPONDENCE TO P. VOGEL RE; SAME,(.5)
RETAINER TO BARON’S NEW BK COUNSEL. (.3)

01/23/13 JRF TELEPHONE CALL FROM 4.40

(.8). DRAFT RECEIVER'S
- R 2 .3). STRATEGY REVIEW WITH DAVID SCHENCK (1.2).

RETURN s e . ) ..

01/24/13 DISCH INITIAL RESEARCH ON POSSIBLE 3.00
: (2.0) AND ASSIGN FURTHER

RESEARCH TO ASSOCIATE, (.5 NC) MEETING W/ J. FINE RE: STRATEGY. (1.0)

01/24/13 JRF VERY EXTENDED TELEPHONE CALL WITH PROPOSED COUNSEL TO NEW 2.50
BANKRUPTCY TRUSTEE, KEVIN MCCULLOUGH, RE COMPREHENSIVE
BACKGROUND OF CASE AND ISSUES TO RESOLVE (1.1). VERY EXTENDED
STRATEGY SESSION WITH DAVID SCHENCK AND CHRIS KRATOVIL RE

1.0). TELEPHONE

CONFERENCE WITH

Fu{ HIS INQUIRY ON UPDATE STATUS (.2). RESPOND TO
Ni IES ON CAR FOR MR. BARON (.1). RESPOND TO INQUIRY ON BARCLAYS

AND RETAINER (.1).
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Dykema

PETER S. VOGEL, RECEIVER CLIENT-MATTER NO. 108946-0001
MARCH 28, 2013 INVOICE NO. 1506461

PAGE NO. 9
DATE ID  DESCRIPTION HOURS
01/24/13 MIMI  RESEARCH RE EFFECT OF ey 5.20

EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH D. SCHENCK RE SAME.

01/25/13 JRF RESPOND TO STEVE COCHELL INQUIRY RE CAR FOR MR. BARON (.3). CONFER 0.70
WITH DAVID SCHENCK ON VARIOUS ISSUES GOING FORWARD (.4).

01/28/13 CDKR RECEIVED AND REVIEWED FIFTH CIRCUIT’S COURT DIRECTIVE ORDERING 0.50
BARON TO FILE RESPONSE TO PETITION FOR EN BANC REVIEW IN THE FIFTH
CIRCUIT (.3). ANALYSIS OF SAME. REVIEW OF STATUS OF PROCEEDINGS IN
FIFTH CIRCUIT (.1) AND PROVIDED UPDATE CONCERNING SAME. (.1)

01/28/13 DJSCH MEETINGS W/ FINE AND KRATOVIL ON FRIDAY RE: PRESSING OR OVERDUE 2.00
MATTERS. (.4) ORDER FROM FIFTH CIRCUIT RE: RESPONSE TO PETITION FOR
EN BANC AND CALLS RE: SAME, (.5) EMAILS FROM OPPOSITION AND fllW
—( 5) MULTIPLE AFTER HOUR EMAILS FROM
[ ____JI5)

01/28/13 JRF EXTENDED TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH Sy 3) AND 1.40
EMAIL TO STEVE COCHELL.(.2) EMAIL TO PETER VOGEL RE UPDATE STATUS
(.2). TELE4PHONE CONFERENCE WITH DAMON NELSON RE SR ( 7)

01/29/13 CDKR  MEETING WITH MR. VOGEL AND MR. FINE AT OFFICES OF GARDERE TO 5.90
DISCUSS CASE STATUS AND STRATEGY. (NC) DRAFTING OF PLEADINGS AND

PAPERS RIQUESTED BY MR. VOGEL, INCLUDING: “

ORDERS ISSUED BY DISTRICT COURT AND BANKRUPTCY COURT FROM
JANUARY 2 TO THE PRESENT. (.4) REVIEW OF E-MAILS. (.2) REVIEW OF
STATUS OF PROCEEDINGS IN FIFTH CIRCUIT AND PROVIDED UPDATE
CONCERNING SAME. (.3)

01/29/13 DISCH REVIEW OF CASES ON JURISDICTION IN FIFTH CIRCUIT AND RELATION 1.80
BETWEEN BANKRUPTCY FILING AND RECEIVERSHIP, (1.5) MEETINGS W/

KRATOVIL AND FINE RE: RECEIVERSHIP MATTERS, (.3) COURT ORD
YEBTERD/\Y S CLIENT DIRECTIVE RE

3 : gy (UNABLE TO ATTEND
DUE TO ILLNESS) CALL FOLLOWING MEETING FOR DETAILED REPORT (.5).

01/29/13 JRF EMAILS RE CAR REQUEST (.2), ATTENTION TO AND MATTERS 3.00
(.5). PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND LENGTHY MEETING WITH PETER VOGEL ON
VARIOUS ISSUES (2.0). REVIEW AND DISCUSS VITH MR.
SCHENCK AND MR. KRATOVIL (.3).

01/30/13 CDKR  DRAFTING OF NOTICE T¢

5.90

. (1.5) DRAFTING OF S
2.0) DRAFTING AND REVISION OF

(1.5) REVIEW OF
ORDERS ISSUED BY DISTRICT COURT AND BANKRUPTCY COURT FROM
JANUARY 2 TO THE PRESENT. (.3)MEETING WITH MR. FINE AND MR. SCHENCK
TO DISCUSS CASE STATUS AND STRATEGY. (NC) REVIEW OF E-MAILS FROM
MR. VOGEL. (.3) CALL FROM MR. URBANICK REGARDING 5TH CIRCUIT ISSUES.

(3)

13-10696.27821
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Dykema

PETER S. VOGEL, RECEIVER CLIENT-MATTER NO. 108946-0001
MARCH 28, 2013 INVOICE NO. 1506461

PAGE NO. 10
DATE ID  DESCRIPTION HOURS
01/30/13 DJSCH EMAILS AND BRIEF MEETINGS W/ FINE RE: BARON’S NEW COUNSEL, BARON'S 1.00

CAR MATTER, (NC) REVIEW OF, REVISIONS TO , AND MEETINGS W/ KRATOVIL
RE: DRAFT MOTIONS (.5), AND EMAILS FROM P. VOGEL RE: SAME. (.5)

01/30/13 IRE WORK ON (e o U R R R R ks 3.70
8). ATTENTION TO VARIOUS SALE, STAY AND OTHER LITIGATION
"ISSUES (.4). EXTENDED TELEPHONE CALL WITH DAMON NELSON RN
1sSUES AND (SRR ). FURTHER RESPONSES TO STEVE
COCHELL (.2). REVIEW CASE LAW FORWARDED BY RICHARD HUNT (1.5).
MEET WITH MS. PARNELL RE DOCUMENT PRODUCTION (NC).

01/31/13 ALP OFFICE CONFERENCES WITH JEFF FINE REGARDING DOCUMENT PRODUCTION 1.00
TO US TRUSTEE (.2); REVIEWED SAME (.8). ‘

01/31/13 CDKR REVIEW OF E-MAILS AND LETTER FROM MR. VOGEL. (.5) REVIEW OF ORDERS 3.00
ISSUED BY DISTRICT COURT AND BANKRUPTCY COURT FROM JANUARY 2 TO
THE PRESENT. EVIEW OF DRAFT PLEADINGS PREPARED —

¥ (1.5) MEETING WITH MR. FINE AND MR. SCHENCK
TO DISCUSS CASE STATUS AND STRATEGY. (NC)

01/31/13 DJSCH  LETTER FROM CLIENT RE: 15 IRIEA T 1.0) 7.50
MULTIPLE MEETINGS AND CALLS RE: SAME (2.0) AND RESPONSE LETTER
DRAFTED, REVISED & CIRCULATED. (3,5)

01/31/13 JRE MEETINGS REGARDING qlo)- 4.00
ANALYZE AND RESEARCH VARIOUS APPELLATE AND BANKRUPTCY ISSUES

(L ST R O URT OF

APPEALS AUTHORITY TO e R S

(2.0).
TOTAL ATTORNEY & PARALEGAL TIME ....ooneniiiiinincenensssiuisssunssnssssassressunssrssssssassarsnse 270.3
TOT AL LEGAL FEES ... o ioiiiiiiitiiettiisiessereiesesssasensasassssssssssasasnsssnssnsnnnns e TS $ 145,305.00
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CEMA

PETER S. VOGEL, RECEIVER CLIENT-MATTER NO. 108946-0001

MARCH 28, 2013

DALLAS\509827 2

INVOICE NO. 1506461
PAGE NO. 11

12/17/12

DISBURSEMENTS

DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPT - KATHY REHLING HEARING NO-CHARGE
TRANSCRIPT ($198.86)

12/14/12 BANK OF AMERICA BANKCARD - WORKING LUNCH NO-CHARGE
REVIEWING DOCUMENTS - JEFF FINE AND DAVID
SCHENCK (18.95)

01/24/13 TITLE CHECKS/SEARCHES - JEFFREY R. FINE 3.08
SECRETARY OF STATE INFORMATION

11/13/12 TRAVEL-EXCEPT AIRFARE, HOTEL & MEALS - DYKEMA 10.00
GOSSETT PETTY CASH, DALLAS OFFICE ALEXA
PARNELL'S PARKING FEE AT COURTHOUSE

01/16/13 TRAVEL-EXCEPT AIRFARE, HOTEL & MEALS - JEFFREY 10.00
R. FINE PARKING AT COURTHOUSE FOR HEARING

01/09/13 FEDEX: RENEE MCDONOUGH : US COURT OF 50.24
APPEALS/FI

01/09/13 SPIRAL BINDER 35.40

01/24/13 LEGAL RESEARCH - WESTLAW 225.05
PHOTOCOPY EXPENSES 4.00
TELECOMMUNICATIONS 1.50
SCANNING EXPENSES 15.40
PRINTING EXPENSES 709.70
CONFERENCE CALLS 28.62
LEGAL RESEARCH - OTHER DATABASES 164.10

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS. ......ccoriimiimneiiianiniiianans $ 1,257.09

NOTE: INCURRED DISBURSEMENTS NOT APPEARING
ON THIS INVOICE WILL BE BILLED LATER.

13-10696.27823
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Dykema

PETER S. VOGEL, RECEIVER
MARCH 28, 2013

CLIENT-MATTER NO.
INVOICE NO. 1506461

PAGE NO. 12

BILLING SUMMARY

108946-0001

ID
JRF
CDKR
DJSCH
RMT
MCWAN
MIMI
ALP

DALLAS\509827.2

TIMEKEEPER HOURS
JEFFREY R. FINE 93.70
CHRISTOPHER D. KRATOVIL 60.60
DAVID J. SCHENCK 96.60
ROSA M. TUMIALAN 9.10
MICHAEL C. WANG 1.40
MELANIE J. CHICO 5.20
ALEXA L. PARNELL 3.70
TOTAL 270.3

RATE
560.00
505.00
570.00
495.00

NC
345.00
235.00

AMOUNT
52,472.00
30,603.00
55,062.00

4,504.50
0.00
1,794.00
869.50

145,305.00

13-10696.27824
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PETER S. VOGEL, RECEIVER CLIENT-MATTER NO. 108946-0001

BARON RECEIVERSHIP MATTERS
MARCH 28, 2013 INVOICE NO. 1506461
PAGE NO. 13
FEES ... oottt $ 145,305.00
DISBURSEMENTS ....oooiiiiiiiiiiiieeeiiiiieeee e 1,257.09
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE......ccccoiimienreni s $__146,562.09

DYKEMAGOSSETTiic

DYKEMA GOSSETT PLLC
DEPT CH 16382
PALATINE, IL 60055-6382

CLIENT CHECK INFORMATION
PLLEASE COMPLETE:
THIS INVOICE IS PAYABLE UPON RECEIPT.

CHECK #: - DATE: AMOUNT:
PLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR REMITTANCE.

FOR FIRM USE:

RECEIVED DATE.:

DALLAS\509827.2 13-10696.27825
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YKEMA

400 Renaissance Center = Detroit, Ml 48243 = EIN# 38-1446628

DUE UPON RECEIPT

PETER S. VOGEL, RECEIVER MARCH 20, 2013
THANKSGIVE TOWER, SUITE 3000 CLIENT-MATTER NO. 108946-0001
1601 ELM STREET INVOICE NO. 1504822

DALLAS, TX 75201

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

RE: BARON RECEIVERSHIP MATTERS

FEES s $ 93,308.50
DISBURSEMENTS jussmssamsosunsssassummasassonsaimsnieanis 457.70
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE.....cccoiiiiiiiiiiiiniieninsisnnnnssnsannann, $__ 93,766.20
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PETER S. VOGEL, RECEIVER CLIENT-MATTER NO. 108946-0001
MARCH 20, 2013 INVOICE NO. 1504822
PAGE NO. 2

RE: BARON RECEIVERSHIP MATTERS

DATE ID DESCRIPTION HOURS

02/01/13 ALP REVIEWED PRIVILEGED DOCUMENTS RE: DOCUMENT PRODUCTION TO US 3.50
TRUSTEE (3.3); OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH JEFF FINE REGARDING SAME (.2).

02/01/13 CDKR CASE ANALYSIS WITH MR. SCHENCK AND MR. FINE (NC). EXCHANGE OF 4.00
CORRESPONDENCE WITH MR. VOGEL, AND ANALYSIS OF SAME, INCLUDING
LEGAL RESEARCH (2.0). PREPARATION OF CORRESPONDENCE RESPONDING
TO QUESTIONS AND CONCERNS g (2.0).

02/01/13 JRF  RESEARCH RE (e VS ey 0.80
PGPSR () . REVIEW LETTER TO PETER VOGEL (.2); MEET WITH
MS. PARNELL (NC).

02/04/13 ALP  CONTINUED REVIEWING PRIVILEGED DOCUMENTS RE: DOCUMENT 4.40
PRODUCTION TO US TRUSTEE (4.1); OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH JEFF FINE
REGARDING SAME (.3).

02/04/13 CDKR  CASE ANALYSIS WITH MR. SCHENCK AND MR. FINE (NC). FORMULATION OF 1.50
STRATEGY TO MANAGE il RDERS OF THE
BANKRUPTCY COURT AND THE DIS

02/04/13 DISCH CALL FROM COURT STAFF RE: AVAILABILITY AND TIMING OF IN CAMERA W/ 1.80
COURT RE: REPRESENTATION MATTER (.2). MEETINGS W/ J. FINE AND
KRATOVIL RE: SAME (.5); REREAD EARLIER ORDERS RE: BANKRUPTCY (.8);
FIFTH CIRCUIT ORDER RE: STAY (.3), FEE AND BILLING ORDERS (1.0 NC).

02/04/13 JRF RESPOND TO VARIOUS RECEIVER EMAILS AND CALLS FROM CREDITORS 1.00
REGARDING CONTINUATION OF INJUNCTION AND BARON STAY (.5); MEETING
RE: POSSIBLE HEARING (.5); MEET WITH MS. PARNELL RE PRIVILEGE LOG

(NC).

02/05/13 ALP  CONTINUED REVIEWING PRIVILEGED DOCUMENTS CONCERNING US TRUSTEE 3.40
PRODUCTION.

02/05/13 ARA  TELEPHONE CALL WITH MR. KRATOVIL AND MR. SCHENCK REGARDING 1.20

UPCOMING EX PARTE HEARING ORDERED BY THE COURT AND CASE
BACKGROUND (.5); BEGIN RESEARCH ON jij i ; '

02/05/13 CDKR  NOTIFICATION OF IN CAMERA HEARING BEFORE JUDGE FURGESON ON 6.00
FEBRUARY 7, AND PREPARATION OF EXHIBITS AND DOCUMENTS FOR THAT
MEETING, INCLUDING :
= (3.5). OUTLINING
OF ARGUMENTS AND POINTS FOR FEBRUARY 7 HEARING (2.5). MEETING
WITH MR. SCHENCK AND MR. FINE REGARDING FEBRUARY 7 HEARING AND
CALL WITH MS. ASHMORE RE SAME (NC).
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PETER S. VOGEL, RECEIVER CLIENT-MATTER NO. 108946-0001
MARCH 20, 2013 INVOICE NO. 1504822
PAGE NO. 3
DATE ID  DESCRIPTION HOURS
02/05/13 DJSCH REVIEWING CORRESPONDENCE AND DRAFT PLEADINGS Gy 4.50
VER THE PAST

MONTH (1.0); CONFERENCE WITH A. ASHMORE RE: PLEADINGS TO BE
DRAFTED/FILED (.5).

02/05/13 JRT CONFERENCES REGARDING LETTERS AND OTHER MATTERS RELATING TO 2.00
RECEIVERSHIP ISSUES (2.0).

02/06/13 ALP CONTINUED REVIEWING PRIVILEGED DOCUMENTS CONCERNING US TRUSTEE 1.20
PRODUCTION.

02/06/13 ARA 5.70

RESEARCH THE APPLICATION OF

S (4. 1): DRAFT E-MAIL
SUMMARY OF RESEARCH AND KEY CASE LAW TO MR. KRATOVIL AND MR.
SCHENCK (1.1); OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH MR. KRATOVIL, MR. SCHENCK,
AND MR. FINE IN PREPARATION FOR HEARING BEFORE COURT REGARDING
REPRESENTATION (.5).

02/06/13 CDKR  CASE ANALYSIS WITH MR. SCHENCK AND MR. FINE (NC). PREPARATION FOR 4.00
HEARING BEFORE JUDGE FURGESON ON FEBRUARY 7 (1.0). RECEIVED AND
REVIEWED CCSB RESPONSE IN OPPOSITION TO PETITION FOR REVIEW ON THE
5TH CIRCUIT, AND ANALYSIS OF SAME (.5). WORK ON RESPONSE TO CCSB
PETITION FOR REVIEW IN THE FIFTH CIRCUIT (2.5).

02/06/13 DISCH RESEARCH ON 7.30
(1.5) AND (il : ; 1
: 1.5), MEET W/ FINE AND KRATOVIL RE; TOMORROW’S
HEARING (1.5), EMAILS AND CALLS FROM URBANIK RE: HEARING (NONE
RETURNED) (.3)

02/06/13 JRF PREPARE FOR 2/7/13 HEARING IN JUDGE FURGESON'S COURT WITH MR. 1.50
SCHENCK AND MR. KRATOVIL (1.5).

02/07/13 ALP CONTINUED REVIEWING PRIVILEGED DOCUMENTS CONCERNING US TRUSTEE 3.50
PRODUCTION.

02/07/13 ARA LEGAL RESEARCH REGARDING 0.40

TR \ \ D -MAIL SUM Y OF SAME (.2);
PREPARATIONS FOR HEARING BEFORE JUDGE FERGUSON (.2).

02/07/13 CDKR  PREPARATION OF EXHIBITS AND DOCUMENTS FOR HEARING BEFORE JUDGE 8.50
FUR(nLQ()N INCLUDING 2 & A

. ; il o A )UI L INING OF
ARGUMENTS AND POINTS FOR FEBRUARY 7 HEARING 4. 0) ATTENDED AND
PARTICIPATED IN FEBRUARY 7 IN CAMERA HEARING BEFORE JUDGE
FURGESON (NC). POST-HEARING MEETING AND ANALYSIS WITH MR.
SCHENCK AND MR. FINE (.5). POST-HEARING EDITING, REVISION, AND
UPDATING OF TH LEADINGS THAT COUNSEL PROPOSES THAT THE
RECEIVER FILE IN THE DISTRICT COURT AND THE BANKRUPTCY COURT, AND
CIRCULATION OF THE SAME FOR APPROVAL (3.5). WORK ON PROPOSED
ORDERS TO ACCOMPANY PLEADINGS (.5).
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PETER S. VOGEL, RECEIVER CLIENT-MATTER NO. 108946-0001
MARCH 20, 2013 INVOICE NO. 1504822

PAGE NO. 4
DATE ID  DESCRIPTION HOURS
02/07/13 DISCH HEARING W/ JUDGE AND RETURN (2.5), REVIEW AND EDIT FOR FORWARDING 7.00

UPDATED PLEADINGS (THROUGH J. FINE) (3.5), REVIEW CARRINGTON FILING
IN FIFTH CIRCUIT (1.0) HEARING POST MORTEM (.5 NC).

02/07/13 JRF PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND IN CAMERA HEARING IN JUDGE FURGESON'S 6.00
COURT (2.5). POST-HEARING ANALYSIS OF HEARING (NC). REVISE AND
FINALIZE 6 PLEADINGS FOR FILING AND REVIEW AND APPROVAL BY THE
RECEIVER (3.5).

02/08/13 ALP BATES LABELED PRIVILEGED DOCUMENTS FOR US TRUSTEE PRODUCTION 1.00
(.5), INCLUDING HAND BATES LABELING CERTAIN EXHIBITS (.5).

02/08/13 ARA BRIEF REVIEW OF DRAFT MOTIONS AND DRAFT PROPOSED ORDERS FOR 3.50

EACH INCLUDING ORDER GRANTING A e ey

02/08/13 DISCH REVIEW BARONS’ RESPONSES TO EN BANC PETITION (1.5), CALLS AND EMAIL 7.60
TO P. VOGEL RE: (Y ( 5), DR AFT RESPONSE
(5.0), CALL TO 5TH CIRCUIT (.2), CARRINGTON TO CONFER (.2), AND VOGEL (.2),
FILE SAME

02/08/13 JRF  REVISE AND FINALIZE MOTION TO J sy /). 3.60
REVIEW AND FORWARD TO RECEIVER BARON MSJ RELATED PAPERS (.6) AND
ANALYZE SAME AND ALL PRIOR BARON INVOLUNTARY FILINGS FOR
RECEIVER (2.6).

02/11/13 ALP DRAFTED PRIVILEGE LOG CONCERNING US TRUSTEE PRODUCTION. 4.00

02/11/13 ARA  CONFER WITH MR. KRATOVIL AND MR. SCHENCK REGARDING MR. VOGEL’S 3.90
RESPONSE TO S (.2 );
DRAFT LANGUAGE FOR INTRODUCTION OF EACH PLEADING INCLUDING LIST
OF CONTEMPORANEOUSLY FILED PLEADINGS TO ALLEVIATE CONCERNS
ABOUT (4SSN 2. 7); EDIT DRAFTS OF SEAPLEADINGS TO
INCORPORATE INTRODUCTORY LANGUAGE AND ADDITIONAL EDITS BY MR.
FINE AND MR. SCHENCK AND CIRCULATE EDITED DRAFTS SHOWING TRACK
CHANGES TO MR. VOGEL (.9).

02/11/13 CDKR PREPARATION FOR MAJOR HEARING BEFORE JUDGE JERNIGAN IN THE 2.50
BANKRUPTCY COURT (2.5). STRATEGY CONFERENCE WITH MR. SCHENCK AND
MR. FINE (NC).

02/11/13 DJSCH EMAILS TO AND FROM P. VOGEL RE: (il 5.00
(1.2), REVIEWING PAST
ORDERS PER|EESSEE) (1 .5), FORWARD REVISED DRAFT AND EMAILS RE:
STATUS AND NEED TO FILE SAME (2.0), ATTEMPTS TO SCHEDULE
G B AR ON RESPONSE TO CCSB MOTION MEET WITH J. FINE AND
MEET WITH A. ASHMORE (.3).
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PETER S. VOGEL, RECEIVER CLIENT-MATTER NO. 108946-0001

MARCH 20, 2013 INVOICE NO. 1504822
PAGE NO. 5
DATE ID  DESCRIPTION HOURS
02/11/13 JRFE  ANALYZE MATTERS REGARDING REPRESENTATION ISSUES TO BE FINALIZED 1.20
WITH DAVID SCHENCK (NC).
02/12/13 ALP  CONTINUED DRAFTING PRIVILEGE LOG CONCERNING US TRUSTEE 2.80
PRODUCTION.
02/12/13 ARA  FINALIZE ADDITIONAL EDITS FROM MR. FINE (.4); CORRESPONDENCE 3.10
REGARDING HEARING THIS AFTERNOON (.2); REVIEW EDITS SUGGESTED BY
MR. VOGEL AND DISCUSS SAME AND THEIR EFEE ITH MR. SCHENCK (.8);
ASSIST IN DRAFTING CORRESPONDENCE TO Sl .7); ANALYSIS AND
STRATEGY IN PREPARATION FOR HEARING WITH COURT (1.0).
02/12/13 CDKR REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF MAJOR HEARING BEFORE JUDGE JERNIGAN IN NC

THE BANKRUPTCY COURT, AND STRATEGY CONFERENCE WITH MR. SCHENCK
AND MR. FINE (NC).

02/12/13 DISCH (CALL RE: AVAILABILITY FOR HEARING TO DISCUSS =R E: 4.50

(.5), INTERNAL MEETING WITH TEAM RE: SAME (.5) AND TO
COURT FOR SAME (2.0 NC). CCSB RESPONSE TO MOTION. MAKE CLIENT EDITS
AND FILE MOTIONS INTO THE EVENING (3.5).

02/12/13 JRF PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND IN CAMERA HEARING IN DISTRICT COURT (2.0) 4.50
(NC). POST-HEARING MEETING WITH RECEIVER (.5) (NC). FINALIZE AND FILE
5 PLEADINGS IN BANKRUPTCY AND DISTRICT COURTS (4.5).

02/13/13 ALP CONTINUED DRAFTING PRIVILEGE LOG CONCERNING US TRUSTEE 3.00
PRODUCTION.
02/13/13 ARA STRATEGY MEETING WITH MR. SCHENCK, MR. FINE, AND MR. KRATOVIL 0.80

REGARDING HEARING IN BANKRUPTCY COURT, EFFECTS OF POSSIBLE
RULINGS, AND STRATEGY FOR NEXT STEPS IN DISTRICT COURT AND

BANKRUPTCY COURT.

02/13/13 DISCH ATTEND HEARING IN BANKRUPTCY COURT (2.5), MEET w/ | R R, 3.50
(.5), AND RETURN. CALL W/ CLIENT RE: STATUS AND g,
T | A\ MEETING (NC).

02/13/13 JRE  REVIEW VARIOUS PLEADINGS TO PREPARE FOR (1.0) AND ATTEND 4.80

BANKRUPTCY COURT HEARING (2.5). AFTER HEARING SETTLEMENT MEETING
WITH PETITIONING CREDITOR DEAN FERGUSON (.5). STRATEGY MEETING
WITH DAVID SCHENCK, MS. ASHMORE, AND CHRIS KRATOVIL (NC). REVIEW
VARIOUS FILINGS MADE BY BARON, CREDITORS AND OTHERS (.8).

02/14/13 ALP CONTINUED DRAFTING PRIVILEGE LOG CONCERNING US TRUSTEE 4.00
PRODUCTION.

02/14/13 ARA DRAFT REQUEST FOR STATUS CONFERENCE (.7); REVISE REQUEST FOR JOINT 1.50
STATUS CONFERENCE TO INCORPORATE AND

REVIEW LOCAL DISTRICT COURT RULES 1
(.4); DRAFT PROPOSED ORDER ON REQUEST FOR STATUS CONFERENCE (.4).
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PETER S. VOGEL, RECEIVER CLIENT-MATTER NO. 108946-0001
MARCH 20, 2013 INVOICE NO. 1504822

PAGE NO. 6
DATE D DESCRIPTION HOURS
02/14/13 DISCH CALL WITH CLIENT RE: [, > ). 3.00

ALTERNATIVES, INCLUDING WPRELIMINARY
RESEARCH ON SAME (1.0), REQUE ON ASHMORE DRAFT SAME (.5),
REVIEW BARON WIND DOWN PLAN (1.0).

02/14/13 JRF  TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PETER VOGEL REGARDING 1.10
5). RESEARCH | s 12}
4). ANALYZE RECEIVER'S POSITION AND DEVELOP
STRATEGY RE (e, ).

02/15/13 ALP CONTINUED DRAFTING PRIVILEGE LOG CONCERNING US TRUSTEE 1.00
PRODUCTION.
02/15/13 DISCH REVIEW AND REVISE MOTION FOR gy 1.0), CIRCULATE 2.30

SAME AND, CONFER W/ PARTIES (1.0) AND STRATEGY MEETING W/ J. FINE (.3).
DISCUSS MOTION FOR SAME STATUS CONFERENCE WITH COCHELL, DEAN
FERGUSON, URBANIK, AND OTHERS, FILE SAME, FURTHER STRATEGY
MEETING W/ J. FINE (.5 NC).

02/15/13 JRF TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH DAVID SCHENCK AND GERRIT PRONSKE (.1), 1.30
LISA LAMBERT (.2), STEVE COCHELL (MULTIPLE) (.2), MARK STROMBERG (.1),
TO MIKE SUTHERLAND (.2), DEAN FERGUSON (.1), PETER VOGEL (.1), EMAIL TO
TRACI DAVIS, AND FINALIZE REQUEST FOR STATUS CONFERENCES AND FILE
SAME (.3) STRATEGY MEETING WITH DAVID SCHENCK (NC) .

02/18/13 ALP OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH JEFF FINE RE: HEARING TRANSCRIPTS FROM 1.10
1/16/13 AND 2/13/13 HEARINGS (.2); CONTINUED DRAFTING PRIVILEGE LOG
CONCERNING US TRUSTEE DOCUMENT PRODUCTION (.9).

02/18/13 CDKR  CONFERENCE WITH MR. SCHENCK AND MR. FINE REGARDING CASE STATUS 0.50
AND STRATEGY (NC). REVIEW OF E-MAILS AND FILINGS (.3). ANALYSIS OF
STATUS OF 5TH CIRCUIT PROCEEDINGS (.2).

02/18/13 DISCH NEW APPEALS FROM BARON CALENDARED (.5). REVIEW JANUARY BILLING 2.00
STATEMENT (1.0), CALL RE: (e, \ \ D EMAILS RE:
SAME (.5), MEETING W/ J. FINE AND KRATOVIL RE: HEARING AND iy
(NC).

02/18/13 JRE  ATTENTION TO Pl) AND 50
INQUIRIES RE BOTIT(3) MEETING WITH DAVID SCHENCK AND CHRIS

KRATOVIL RE: SAME (NC) MEETING WITH MS. ASHMORE RE TRANSCRIPT
(NC)..

02/19/13 ALP TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH COURT REPORTERS RE: HEARING 2.50
TRANSCRIPTS NEEDED FROM 1/16/13 AND 2/13/13 HEARINGS (.2); OFFICE
CONFERENCES WITH JEFF FINE AND DAVID SCHENCK REGARDING HEARING
TRANSCRIPTS (.2); CONTINUED DRAFTING PRIVILEGE LOG CONCERNING US
TRUSTEE DOCUMENT PRODUCTION (2.1).

02/19/13 ARA  DRAFT MOTION FOR (e 1.00
(.7); DRAFT NOTICE OF HEARING FOR THREE FILINGS (.2); CORRESPONDENCE
WITH MR. FINE REGARDING MOTION AND NOTICE (.1).
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Dykema

PETER S. VOGEL, RECEIVER CLIENT-MATTER NO. 108946-0001
MARCH 20, 2013 INVOICE NO. 1504822

PAGE NO. 7
DATE ID  DESCRIPTION HOURS
02/19/13 DJSCH FEBRUARY PAYMENT FROM (NSNS ). ORDER FROM 5TH 1.90

CIRCUIT AND CALL TO 5TH CIRCUIT RE: NEW APPEALS (.5) AND PROCESSING
OF SAME, D. NELSON PROPOSED PAYMENT SCHEDULE FOR DOMAIN
HOLDINGS (.5), MEETING W/ J. FINE RE:

(.4).
02/19/13 JRE  ATTENTION TO OBTAINING SETTINGS WITH DEPUTY CLERK (.2). 0.20
02/19/13 JRE  REVISE MOTION TO (e +) AND MEET WITH DAVID 0.40
SCHENCK RE: MOTIONS (NC).
02/20/13 ALP  TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH COURT REPORTER RE: HEARING TRANSCRIPT 3.50

NEEDED FOR 2/13/13 HEARING (.2); CONTINUED DRAFTING PRIVILEGE LOG
CONCERNING US TRUSTEE DOCUMENT PRODUCTION (3.3).

02/20/13 ARA ATTENTION TO EXHIBITS NEEDED FOR REQUEST FOR AUTHORITY TO PAY 0.30
EXPENSES (.2); EDIT NOTICE OF HEARING (.1).
02/20/13 DJSCH COURT REPORTER MOTION REVIEWED FOR NEW VERSION WITH ADDITIONAL 3.50

BILLS (.5), CALL & EMAILS W/ P. VOGEL RE: PENDING MATTERS AND HEARING
(.5), CONFERENCE RE: PENDING APPEALS OF BANKRUPTCY COURT ORDER,

SN 1.0), EMAILS CALL AND DRAFT LETTER RESPONSE TO SAME AND
BRIEF MEETING WITH J. FINE RE: SAME (1.5).

02/20/13 JRF  PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND ONDOVA BANKRUPTCY STATUS CONFERENCE 4.00
(2.0). POST CONFERENCE DISCUSSIONS WITH CORKY SHERMAN AND
RICHARD HUNT AND OTHERS (.5). MEET WITH DAVID SCHENCK RE Vil
S e ROy, | 5),

02/21/13 ALP CONTINUED DRAFTING PRIVILEGE LOG CONCERNING US TRUSTEE 2.90
DOCUMENT PRODUCTION.

02/21/13 DISCH MEETING W/ J. FINE RE: PENDING MOTIONS, HEARING IN BANKRUPTCY 0.50
COURT AND STRATEGY GOING FORWARD

02/21/13 JRT DRAFT AND FILE NOTICE OF HEARINGS FOR 3/19 AND FILE SAME IN 1.80

BANKRUPTCY AND DISTRICT COURTS AND ATTENTION TO SERVICE OF SAME
(.6). CONFERENCES WITH DAMON NELSON AND DAVID SCHENCK RE

AND HOW TO RESPOND TO SAME (.5). REVIEW
LATEST FILINGS IN BARON MATTER (.7).

02/22/13 ALP CONTINUED DRAFTING PRIVILEGE LOG CONCERNING US TRUSTEE 2.50
DOCUMENT PRODUCTION.
02/22/13 DISCH MEETING W/ J./ FINE AND CALL TO P. VOGEL RE: (i Sl 1.50

ISSUE (.5), EMAILS AND LETTER DRAFTED AND CIRCULATED BY J. FINE RE:
SAME (.5); CALL W/ P. VOGEL RE:
MOTIONS AND STATUS CONFERENCE (.5).
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Dykema

PETER S. VOGEL, RECEIVER CLIENT-MATTER NO. 108946-0001
MARCH 20, 2013 INVOICE NO. 1504822

PAGE NO. 8
DATE ID  DESCRIPTION HOURS
02/22/13 JRF  RESEARCH AND RESPOND TO EMAILS TO 3.30

(1.4), EMAIL TO
EXTENDED TELEPHONE CALL WITH DAMON NELSON RE SAME (.5).
TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH PETER VOGEL RE

TR T R I ATy
RESPOND TO SIMILAR 4). TELEPHONE CONFERENCE
WITH JASON CROSS, ICW@; MEETING
WITH DAVID SCHENCK AND CALL TO PETER VOGEL RE ()
STRATEGY (.5)..

02/24/13 JRE  ATTENTION TO INQUIRY FROM PETER VOGEL ON VARIOUS DISTRICT COURT 0.20
ENTRIES (.2).

o

022513 DIsCH  MEETING W/ J. FINE RE: [ 3.00
SmE¥ (3) AND CONFERENCES W/ MR. URBANIK AND PRONSKE (1.0), REVIEW
TRANSCRIPT ORDER REQUEST (.5), CALL TO COURT REPORTER RE:
PROCESSING OF SAME (.2), READING BARON WIND DOWN PLAN (.5); CALL
FROM P. VOGEL RE: ([ ;).

02/25/13 JRF  EXTENDED TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ICANN COUNSEL RE (i N 1.60
W 3). ATTENTION TO VARIOUS
(.3). ATTENTION TO DOMAIN HOLDINGS GROUP
1ssues .- ). TF1EPHONE CONFERENCE WITH
PROSPECTIVE PURCHASER'S COUNSEL STEVAN LIEBERMAN RE STATUS OF
CASES (.4). BRIEF MEETING WITH DAVID SCHENCK RE: SAME (.3).

02/26/13 ALP  CONTINUED DRAFTING PRIVILEGE LOG CONCERNING US TRUSTEE 2.30
DOCUMENT PRODUCTION.

02/26/13 ~ DISCH REVIEWING JANUARY TIME AND BILLING MATTERS. 0.50

02/26/13 JRE - RESPOND TO INQUIRIES RE iy 0.30

WETERDRCTR

02/27/13 ALP  CONTINUED DRAFTING PRIVILEGE LOG CONCERNING US TRUSTEE 2.20
DOCUMENT PRODUCTION.

02/27/13 TRU U e e A R T AR i R ST 2.00
(2.0).

02/27/13 JRF  ATTENTION TO LATEST APPEAL STATUS ISSUES (.2). 0.20

02/28/13 ALP  CONTINUED DRAFTING PRIVILEGE LOG CONCERNING US TRUSTEE 3.90
DOCUMENT PRODUCTION.

02/28/13 JRF  ANALYZE PETITIONING CREDITORS POSITION THAT INVOLUNTARY 3.00

BANKRUPTCY DIVESTS RECEIVERSHIP (2.5) AND REPORT ON SAME (.5).

TOTAL ATTORNEY & PARALEGAL TIME ..ot e snsisnensssss e sesenes 205.80
TOTAL LEGAL FEES jsisainssecsvisucannssssiinsssssiiiisssssmstssssmiimyisn s i isomssss siiisnmemn $ 93,308.50
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DyKema

PETER S. VOGEL, RECEIVER CLIENT-MATTER NO. 108946-0001
MARCH 20, 2013 INVOICE NO. 1504822
PAGE NO. 9
DISBURSEMENTS
02/11/13  TRAVEL-EXCEPT AIRFARE, HOTEL & MEALS - JEFFREY 8.00
R. FINE PARKING AT COURTHOUSE FOR HEARING
02/13/13  TRAVEL-EXCEPT AIRFARE, HOTEL & MEALS - DAVID J. 30.00
SCHENCK PARKING WHILE AT COURTHOUSE
02/20/13  TRAVEL-EXCEPT AIRFARE, HOTEL & MEALS - JEFFREY 10.00
R. FINE PARKING AT COURTHOUSE FOR HEARING
PHOTOCOPY EXPENSES 182.00
SCANNING EXPENSES 41.40
PRINTING EXPENSES 154.80
LEGAL RESEARCH - OTHER DATABASES 31.50
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS. .......cocieemeeveeeenerrennns $ 457.70

NOTE: INCURRED DISBURSEMENTS NOT APPEARING
ON THIS INVOICE WILL BE BILLED LATER.

13-10696.27834
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PETER S. VOGEL, RECEIVER
MARCH 20, 2013

CLIENT-MATTER NO.
INVOICE NO. 1504822

PAGE NO. 10

BILLING SUMMARY

108946-0001

1D
JRF
CDKR
DISCH
ARA
ALP

DALLAS\509873.2

TIMEKEEPER HOURS

J EFFREY_R. F_IN_E 45.30

CHRISTOPHER D. KRATOVIL 27.00

DAVID J. SCHENCK 59.40

ALISON R. ASHMORE 21.40

ALEXA L.PARNELL 52.70
TOTAL 205.80

RATE
560.00
505.00
570.00
320.00
235.00

AMOUNT
25,368.00
14,850.00
33,858.00

6,848.00
12,384.50

93,308.50

13-10696.27835


13-10696.27835


D 1ase 3:09-cv-00988-L Document 1234-8 Filed 04/17/13 Page 25 of 37 PagelD 63475

PETER S. VOGEL, RECEIVER CLIENT-MATTER NO. 108946-0001

BARON RECEIVERSHIP MATTERS
MARCH 20, 2013 INVOICE NO. 1504822
PAGE NO. 11
FEES .ot $ 93,308.50
DISBURSEMENTS iuiissusssusimerissmsnmsnsrsmsasensnissvesssmmss 457.70
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE........cccciremimnimnecrinimnnisssnnennnns $__ 93,766.20

DYKeMAGOSSETTh1c

DYKEMA GOSSETT PLLC
DEPT CH 16382
PALATINE, IL 60055-6382

CLIENT CHECK INFORMATION

PLEASE COMPLETE:

THIS INVOICE IS PAYABLE UPON RECEIPT.

CHECK #: _ DATE: AMOUNT:
PLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR REMITTANCE.

FOR FIRM USE:

RECEIVED DATE:

13-10696.27836
DALLAS\509873.2
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YKEMA

400 Renaissance Center = Detroit, Ml 48243 = EIN# 38-1446628

PETER S. VOGEL, RECEIVER
THANKSGIVE TOWER, SUITE 3000
1601 ELM STREET

DALLAS, TX 75201

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

RE: BARON RECEIVERSHIP MATTERS

DALLAS\509874.2

DUE UPON RECEIPT

APRIL 8, 2013
CLIENT-MATTER NO. 108946-0001
INVOICE NO. 1507990

............................. $ 112,864.00

1,685.40
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Dykema

PETER S. VOGEL, RECEIVER CLIENT-MATTER NO. 108946-0001
APRIL 8, 2013 INVOICE NO. 1507990
PAGE NO. 2

RE: BARON RECEIVERSHIP MATTERS

DATE ID  DESCRIPTION HOURS

03/01/13 ALP  CONTINUED DRAFTING PRIVILEGE LOG CONCERNING US TRUSTEE 3.20
DOCUMENT PRODUCTION.

03/01/13 DJSCH CALL TO J. MACPETE RE: COMPLIANCE WITH ORDER (.2), BEGAN DRAFT 2.00
MOTION .0), MEETINGS WITH J. FINE RE:

3), FIFTH CIRCUIT ORDER (.2), EMAILS W/ P. VOGEL

RE: (R ).

03/01/13 JRF REVIEW LATEST il A ND CORRESPONDENCE (.3) AND MEET WITH 0.60
DJS BRIEFLY RE: SAME (.3).

03/04/13 ALP  CONTINUED DRAFTING PRIVILEGE LOG CONCERNING US TRUSTEE 3.70
DOCUMENT PRODUCTION.

03/04/13 DISCH  CALL wITH P. VOGEL RE: [ R 5) C/LL TO JOSH 0.80
COX (.3).

03/05/13 ALP  CONTINUED DRAFTING PRIVILEGE LOG CONCERNING US TRUSTEE 3.80
DOCUMENT PRODUCTION.

03/05/13 CDKR  RECEIVED AND REVIEWED MULTIPLE FILINGS FROM MR. BARON 2.00

RESPONDING TO THE RECEIVER'S MOTIONS TO PAY HIS PROFESSIONALS (1.3).
ANALYSIS OF THE SAME AND INITIAL WORK ON RESPONSES (.7).
CONFERENCE WITH MR. SCHENCK AND MR. FINE REGARDING SAME (NC).

03/05/13 DISCH REVIEW NEW BARON FILINGS RE: OUTSTANDING FEE MATTERS (.5), CALL 2.50
AND EMAILS WITH VOGEL RE: SAME (.3), CALL AND EMAIL WITH M. MORRIS
RE: PAYMENT (.2), REVIEW AND REVISE FEBRUARY STATEMENT (1.0),
MEETING WITH C. KRATOVIL RE: MOTIONS (.5) RE:

03/06/13 ALP CONTINUED DRAFTING PRIVILEGE LOG CONCERNING US TRUSTEE 5.60
DOCUMENT PRODUCTION.

030613 cpkr  DRAFTING OF MoTION To i .
BY THE JANUARY 2 ORDER OF
THE DISTRICT COURT (1.0). CONFERENCE WITH MR. SCHENCK REGARDING
SAME (NC).

03/06/13 DJSCH CALLS AND EMAILS WITH P. VOGEL RE: DRAFT MOTION RE: (i .5), 2.00
MEETING WITH C. KRATOVIL AND J. FINE RE SAME (.5), OUTLINE CONTEMPT
MOTIONS WITH KRATOVIL (.5) AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH ICAAN W/ J.
FINE (.5); CALL TO 5TH CIR. CLERK RE; STATUS OF EN BANC PETITION (.2 NC).

13-10696.27838
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Dykeva

PETER S. VOGEL, RECEIVER CLIENT-MATTER NO. 108946-0001
APRIL 8, 2013 INVOICE NO. 1507990

PAGE NO. 3
DATE ID  DESCRIPTION HOURS
03/07/13 ALP  CONTINUED DRAFTING PRIVILEGE LOG CONCERNING US TRUSTEE 3.70

DOCUMENT PRODUCTION (3.0); OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH DAVID SCHENCK
REGARDING OUTSTANDING INVOICES TO COURT REPORTERS AND MOTION
FILED REGARDING SAME (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH COURT
REPORTERS REGARDING SAME (.2).

03/07/13 CDKR  DRAFTING, EDITING AND REVISION OF MOTION TO 4.50
: : BY
THE JANUARY 2 ORDER OF THE DISTRICT COURT (4.0). CONFERENCE WITH
MR. SCHENCK REGARDING SAME. CIRCULATION OF COMPLETED DRAFT TO
MR. VOGEL AND TEAM, AND PREPARATION TO FILE SAME (.5).

03/07/13 DJSCH CALL WITH P. VOGEL (.2) AND CALL TO J. MACPETE (SECOND) TO CONFER ON 3.50

2), REVIEW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT MOTION

(1.6), FORWARD SAME AND REVIEW VOGEL COMMENTS (.2), REVISIONS TO

FEBRUARY TIME AND BILL (.5 NC); REVIEWING COURT REPORTER BILLS FOR

POSSIBLE SUPPLEMENTAL MOTION (.5), MEET WITH I. FINE RE: APPLICATION

FOR GRANT THORNTON (.3), BARON’S NEW LOCAL COUNSEL; MEET WITH A.

PARNELL RE: CONFIRMING TOTAL OUTSTANDING COURT REPORTER

INVOICES (.5).

03/07/13 JRE  VERY EXTENDED TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DOMAIN NAME UDRP 0.40
CLAIMANT ATTORNEY LARRY LICHTMAN RE STATUS OF THEIR CLAIM AND
4); MEETING WITH
DJS RE: SAME (NC).

03/08/13 ALP CONTINUED DRAFTING PRIVILEGE LOG CONCERNING US TRUSTEE 1.80
DOCUMENT PRODUCTION (1.0); DRAFTED E-MAIL TO AND MEET WITH DAVID
SCHENCK REGARDING COURT REPORTER INVOICES (.5); TELEPHONE
CONFERENCES WITH COURT REPORTERS REGARDING SAME (.2); OFFICE
CONFERENCE WITH JEFF FINE REGARDING SAME (.1).

03/08/13 CDKR  FINAL REVIEW, EDITING AND FILING AND SERVICE OF MOTION TO HOLDS 0.50
NETSPHERE IN CONTEMPT FOR ITS FAILURE TO PAY THE SETTLEMENT AS
COMMANDED BY THE JANUARY 2 ORDER OF THE DISTRICT COURT.

03/08/13 DJSCH REVIEW FINAL CONTEMPT DRAFT RE: NETSPHERE (1.0), MAKE P. VOGEL 2.50
REVISIONS, FINALIZE AND FILE CONTEMPT (.6). MEETING WITH J. FINE RE:
— ORRESPONDENCE/MOTION, MOTION RE: (i R, )
AND MEET W/ ALEXA PARNELL RE: STATUS OF COURT REPORTERS BILLS (.5).

03/08/13 JRF  DRAFT MOTION TO NS ). ANALYZE Wy 2.10
RESPONSES AND HOW TO PROCEED (.7) AND MEET WITH DAVID SCHENCK RE:
SAME (.4).

03/11/13 CDKR CONFERENCE WITH MR. SCHENCK AND MR. FINE REGARDING CASE STATUS NC
AND STRATEGY (NC).

03/11/13 DJSCH READING OBJECTIONS AND RESPONSES OF THE PARTIES (1.5), MEETING WITH 2.00

FINE AND KRATOVIL RE: REPLY (.5).

DALLAS\S09874.2 13'10696.27839
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Dykema

PETER S. VOGEL, RECEIVER CLIENT-MATTER NO. 108946-0001
APRIL 8, 2013 INVOICE NO. 1507990
PAGE NO. 4
DATE D DESCRIPTION HOURS
03/11/13 JRF CONFERENCE WITH JOSHUA COX RE NUMEROUS .. 1.00
INQUIRIES AND HOW HE SUGGESTS WE RESPOND TO SAME (.3). RESEARCH
hﬂ U=l Tk
03/12/13 ALP  RESEARCHED PACER REGARDING NUMEROUS OBJECTIONS/RESPONSES FILED 2.50

IN THE JEFFREY BARON USBC MATTER AND NETSPHERE USDC MATTER
REGARDING RECEIVER'S EXPEDITED APPLICATION TO PAY EXPENSES (.8);
PULLED SAME (1.5); AND DRAFTED E-MAILS TO JEFF FINE, CHRIS KRATOVIL
AND DAVID SCHENCK (.2).

03/12/13 CDKR  PREPARATION FOR JOINT HEARING BEFORE DISTRICT COURT AND 1.00
BANKRUPTCY COURT ON MARCH 19. REVIEW OF OBJECTIONS AND
RESPONSES FILED BY NUMEROUS PARTIES TO THE RECEIVER'S MOTIONS (1.0).

03/12/13 DISCH COMPLETED READING OF RESPONSES/OBJECTIONS (1.0), PULLING 3.00
AUTHORITIES CITED (1.0); RECEIVED AND REVIEWED CARRINGTON RESPONSE
(.2); & BARCLAY’S UPDATE WITH CLIENT AND J. FINE (.3), MEET WITH FINE
AND KRATOVIL RE: ASSIGNED DRAFTING TASKS (.5).

03/12/13 JRF REVIEW AND MAKE NOTES RE 13 SEPARATE OBJECTIONS AND RESPONSES TO 3.50
RECEIVER APPLICATIONS (2.4). CONFER WITH DAVID SCHENCK AND CHRIS
KRATOVIL RE HOW TO RESPOND TO SAME (.5). DRAT'T EMAIL TO BARBOUR

INTERNATIONAL LONDON COUNSEL RE (Y ).

03/13/13 ALP  REVIEWED E-MAIL REQUEST FROM STEVE COCHELL REGARDING "UNDER 2.50
SEAL" EXHIBITS FROM NOVEMBER, 2012 CONFIRMATION HEARING (1.3);
REVIEWED EXHIBITS AND PULLED SAME PER COCHELL'S REQUEST (2.0);
OFFICE CONFERENCE AND FOLLOW-UP E-MAIL WITH JEFF FINE REGARDING
SAME (.2).

03/13/13 CDKR  DRAFTING OF OMNIBUS RESPONSE TO SNy 2.30
EWETPY R v A s R AT | SIS NSTIFES AL
PREPARATION FOR JOINT HEARING BEFORE THE DISTRICT COURT AND THE
BANKRUPTCY COURT ON MARCH 19, 2013 (.5).

03/13/13 DISCH INITIAL DRAFTING REPLY AND RESEARCH ON (e 3.50

S BRIEF MEETING WITH MR. KRATOVIL AND MR. FINE (NC).

03/13/13 JRF RESEARCH AND ANALYZE RESPONSES TO MULTIPLE OBJECTIONS AND 2.30
RESPONSES FOR MARCH 19 HEARING (2.0). CONFER WITH DAVID SCHENCK
AND CHRIS KRATOVIL RE SAME (.3).

03/14/13 ALP NUMEROUS OFFICE CONFERENCES WITH JEFF FINE AND DAVID SCHENCK RE: 5.00
CERTAIN TESTIMONY IN HEARING TRANSCRIPTS FROM 1/16/13 AND 2/13/13 (.8);
RESEARCHED AND REVIEWED BOTH TRANSCRIPTS REGARDING SAME (2.2);
ASSISTED DAVID SCHENCK IN RESEARCHING AND PREPARATION OF
EXHIBITS FOR OMNIBUS OBJECTION TO RESPONSE (2.0).

DALLAS\509874.2 13-10696.27840
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DyKema

PETER S. VOGEL, RECEIVER CLIENT-MATTER NO. 108946-0001
APRIL 8, 2013 INVOICE NO. 1507990

PAGE NO. 5
DATE ID  DESCRIPTION HOURS
03/14/13 CDKR  PRIMARY DRAFTING OF OMNIBUS RESPONSE TO OBJECTIONS TO RECEIVER'S 10.00

WIND-DOWN PLAN AND MOTION TO PAY THE RECEIVER'S PROFESSIONALS.
PREPARATION FOR JOINT HEARING BEFORE THE DISTRICT COURT AND THE
BANKRUPTCY COURT ON MARCH 19, 2013 (8.0). CONFERENCE REGARDING
CASE STATUS AND STRATEGY WITH MR. SCHENCK AND MR. FINE (NC).
EDITING AND REVISION OF OMNIBUS RESPONSE AND PREPARATION FOR
FILING IN DISTRICT COURT (2.0).

03/14/13 DJSCH DRAFTING e | 5 ) 7.00
REVIEW AND EDIT KRATOVIL CONTRIBUTION (2.0) & MEET WITH
FINKELSTEIN AND FINE RE:
1.5).
03/14/13 JRE  CALL WITH PETER VOGEL DISCUSSING PRESENTATION FOR MARCH 19 4.30

HEARING (.3). DRAFT OMNIBUS RESPONSE TO MULTIPLE OBJECTIONS (2.5)
AND CONFERENCES WITH DAVID SCHENCK RE SAME (1.5).

03/14/13 WBF REVIEW GARDERE OBJECTION (.4); WORK SESSION WITH DAVID SCHENCK RE: 2.80

: (1:6); DEVELOP ARGUMENTS FOR REPLY (.8).

03/15/13 ALP OFFICE CONFERENCES WITH JEFF FINE, DAVID SCHENCK AND ALISON 0.50
ASHMORE, RE: CERTAIN TESTIMONY IN HEARING TRANSCRIPTS FROM 1/16/13
AND 2/13/13 (.2); RESEARCHED AND REVIEWED BOTH TRANSCRIPTS
REGARDING SAME RE: PREPARATION OF OMNIBUS OBJECTION TO RESPONSE

(3).
03/15/13 ARA  RESEARCH ON WAIVER OF ey 6.40

ND ADD
CITATIONS FOR RESPONSE TO BARON’S OBJECTIONS (.5); WORK ON DRAFT
OMNIBUS REPLY TO VARIOUS OBJECTIONS AND MEET WITH MR. SCHENCK RE
SAME (5.9).

03/15/13 CDKR  EDITING, REVISION AND REVIEW OF OMNIBUS RESPONSE TO OBJECTIONS TO 2.00
RECEIVER'S WIND-DOWN PLAN AND MOTION TO PAY THE RECEIVER'S
PROFESSIONALS (2.0).

03/15/13 DJSCH  FINALIZE AND CIRCULATE OMNIBUS REPLY (2.0), MEETING W/ FINE RE -S|} 8.00
.5), MEET WITH A. ASHMORE RE: SAME (.5), REVIEW AND REVISE
(3.5), CIRCULATE TO CLIENT (.5).

03/15/13 JRE  DRAFT SECTIONS OF RECEIVER'S OMNIBUS RESPONSE TO MULTIPLE 4.00
OBJECTIONS (4.0).

03/17/13 DJSCH REVISE BOTH REPLIES, NOTICE OF HEARING FOR TOMORROW AND CALL RE: 4.50
SAME

03/17/13 JRF  DRAFT PORTIONS OF AND REVISE OMNIBUS RECEIVER'S REPLY TO VARIOUS 3.00

OBJECTIONS (3.0).
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PETER S. VOGEL, RECEIVER CLIENT-MATTER NO. 108946-0001
APRIL 8, 2013 INVOICE NO. 1507990

PAGE NO. 6
DATE ID  DESCRIPTION HOURS
03/18/13 CDKR  EDITING, REVIEW AND REVISION OF RECEIVER’S OMNIBUS REPLY TO 4.50

OBJECTIONS OF MR. BARON, GARDERE, MUNCH HARDT AND THE
PETITIONING CREDITORS (4.0). CONFERENCE WITH MR. SCHENCK
REGARDING SAME (NC). PREPARATION FOR EMERGENCY HEARING BEFORE
JUDGE JERNIGAN AND POSTPONEMENT OF MARCH 19 JOINT STATUS
CONFERENCE (.5).

03/18/13 DJSCH RESPONSES TO OBJECTIONS AND RESPONSES AND SEPARATE RESPONSE RE: 5.50
GARDERE AND ONDOVA TRUSTEE.

03/18/13 JRF  REVISE AND FINALIZE AND FILE RECEIVER'S OMNIBUS REPLY TO OBJECTIONS 6.50
AND RESPONSES (2.0). PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND HASTILY CALLED STATUS
CONFERENCE AND POST HEARING MEETINGS RE NEW SETTLEMENT AGENDA
(2.9). VERY EXTENDED SETTLEMENT CALL WITH PRONSKE AND ANALYSIS OF
1.6).

03/19/13 ALP OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH DAVID SCHENCK REGARDING HEARING 5.80
TRANSCRIPT OF CERTAIN HEARING IN JUDGE FERGUSON'S COURT (.2);
RESEARCH REGARDING SAME (.7); PULLING AND RESEARCHING VARIOUS
PLEADINGS IN BARON AND ONDOVA BANKRUPTCY MATTERS AS WELL AS
NETSPHERE USDC CASE (1.2); REVIEWING MUNSCH HARDT'S FEE
APPLICATIONS IN ONDOVA BANKRUPTCY MATTER (2.5); DRAFTED "TOTAL
FEES OWED TO MUNSCH HARDT" STATEMENT AS WELL AS E-MAIL TO DAVID
SCHENCK REGARDING SAME (.9); DRAFTED LETTERS TO COURT REPORTERS
(ESCRIBERS AND WORLDWIDE) FOR JEFF FINE REGARDING PAYMENT (.3).

03/19/13 CDKR  PREPARATION FOR COURT-ORDERED MANDATORY SETTLEMENT 2.50
NEGOTIATIONS (2.5). IN-PERSON CONFERENCE WITH MR. VOGEL REGARDING
(NC).
03/19/13 DJSCH SETTLEMENT CONFERENCES WITH TEAM (.3) AND CHECKING WITH FIFTH 1.50

CIRCUIT RE: STATUS OF EN BANC AND BARON PETITIONS (.2), REVIEW BILLS
(.8); MEETING WITH MS. PARNELL RE TRANSCRIPT (.2).

03/19/13 JRE  ANALYSIS OF PROPOSED SETTLEMENT AND DEFICIENCIES WITH SAME (2.5); 5.30
MEETINGS WITH PETER VOGEL RE SAME WHICH INCLUDED A VERY LENGTHY
SETTLEMENT CALL WITH RAY URBANIK (2.0). ADDRESS DOMAIN NAME
CLAIMANT LICHTMAN REQUEST RE (.2). ADDRESS
VARIOUS DAMON NELSON REQUESTS
¥R D PAYMENT TO COURT REPORTERS (.6).

03/20/13 CDKR  DRAFTING, EDITING AND REVISION OF THE RECEIVER’S NOTICE OF 6.50

lh

DISCUSSION OF OPTIMAL TIME TO FILE SAME (6.0). PREPARATION FOR
COURT-ORDERED MANDATORY SETTLEMENT NEGOTIATIONS (.5). MULTIPLE
CONFERENCES WITH MR. SCHENCK AND MR. FINE AND MR. FINKELSTEIN, AS
WELL AS WITH MR. VOGEL (NC).

03/20/13 DISCH REVIEW AND REVISE RECEIVER'S NOTICE OF 1 1.00

|

13-10696.27842
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PETER S. VOGEL, RECEIVER CLIENT-MATTER NO. 108946-0001
APRIL 8, 2013 INVOICE NO. 1507990

PAGE NO. 7
DATE ID  DESCRIPTION HOURS
03/20/13 DJSCH CASHFLOW ANALYSIS FOR SETTLEMENT TALKS (1.5), PULLING AND 4.50

REVIEWING FEE APPS. OF THE OTHER PARTIES (2.5), EMAILS RE: SAME,
MEETING WITH TEAM (.5); STRATEGY METING WITH MR. FINE AND MR.
FINKELSTEIN (1.2 NC).

03/20/13 JRF VERY EXTENDED TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DAMON NELSON RE 2.70
VARIOUS PORTFOLIO ISSUES AND STATUS OF CASES AND SETTLEMENT
DISCUSSIONS (.7). TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH GERRIT PRONSKE RE
STATUS OF SETTLEMENT NEGOTIATIONS (.2). EMAILS TO RAY URBANIK AND
OTHERS RE SETTLEMENT INFORMATION REQUESTS (.3). STRATEGY MEETING
WITH DAVID SCHENCK TO PREPARE FOR SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE (1.2).
WORK ON REVISING RESERVATION OF RIGHTS (.3).

03/20/13 WBF STRATEGY WITH DAVID SCHENCK AND CHRIS KRATOVIL RE: UPCOMING 1.20
SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE AND HEARING

03/21/13 CDKR PREPARATION FOR COURT-ORDERED MANDATORY SETTLEMENT 7.50
NEGOTIATIONS (.5). ATTENDED AND PARTICIPATED IN COURT-ORDERED
MANDATORY SETTLEMENT NEGOTIATIONS AT THE OFFICES OF MUNCH
HARDT; DURING COURSE OF NEGOTIATIONS MULTIPLE CONFERENCES WITH
OPPOSING COUNSEL, AS WELL AS WITH MR. VOGEL AND MR. SCHENCK AND
MR. FINE (5.0). DRAFTING AND EDITING OF NOTICE OF
2.0).

03/21/13 DIJSCH PETER VOGEL’S BILLS (.5), REVIEW EDITS TO DYKEMA’S BILL (.5 NC), REVIEW 5.00
SPREADSHEET FROM URBANIK (.5) ATTEND SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE (4.0);
MEETING WITH JEFF FINE REGARDING LIEBERMAN CALL (.5 NC) .

03/21/13 JRF VERY EXTENDED TELEPHONE CONFERENCE INITIATED BY STEVAN 5.10
LIEBERMAN ADVISING THAT

NIRRT PARTICIPATE IN MANDATORY SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE
(4.3).

03/22/13 CDKR  CALL WITH COUNSEL TO MR. BARON REGARDING SETTLEMENT 1.50
POSSIBILITIES (1.0). REVIEW AND EDITING OF LETTERS TO RAY URBANICK
AND RICH ROBBERSON URGING THEM TO
5).

03/22/13 DIJSCH CALLS FROM BARON’S COUNSEL RE: SETTLEMENT AND TAX ISSUES (.8), 2.80
LETTERS TO URBANIK AND GARDERE (1.5), REDACTING BILLS FOR FILING (.5).

03/22/13 IRF TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PETER VOGEL RE LATEST UPDATE ON 1.90
SETTLEMENT INITIATIVE (.3). REVIEW AND REVISE LETTERS TO ROBERSON
AND URBANIK (.4). VERY EXTENDED TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MARK
STROMBERG AND STEVE COCHELL RE SETTLEMENT POTENTIAL (1.2).

03/25/13 CDKR  PREPARATION FOR COURT-ORDERED MANDATORY SETTLEMENT 1.50
NEGOTIATIONS (1.5). MULTIPLE CONFERENCES WITH MR. SCHENCK AND MR.
FINE, AS WELL AS WITH MR. VOGEL (NC). REVIEW OF KEY PLEADINGS AND
ORDERS. REVIEW OF CASE STATUS AND STRATEGY (NC).
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PAGE NO. 8
DATE ID DESCRIPTION HOURS
03/25/13 DISCH COMMUNICATIONS W/ P. VOGEL RE: Ny 2.50

AND STATUS OF SAME (.5), CALL W/ D. NELSON RE: G IR
).5), SETTLEMENT CALL WITH
PRONSKE AND ASSOCIATE (.5).

03/25/13 JRF  EXTENDED TELEPHONE CALLS WITH MARK STROMBERG RE SETTLEMENT 3.90
POSSIBILITIES (.9), WITH PETER VOGEL (.5), WITH STEVAN LIEBERMAN (.3).
STRATEGIES RE 3). REVIEW
INFORMATION AND ANALYZE ¥
9).
03/26/13 CDKR  ATTENDED AND PARTICIPATED IN COURT-ORDERED MANDATORY 7.00

SETTLEMENT NEGOTIATIONS AT THE OFFICES OF MUCH HARDT; DURING
COURSE OF NEGOTIATIONS, MULTIPLE CONFERENCES WITH OPPOSING
COUNSEL, AS WELL AS WITH MR. VOGEL. REVIEW OF KEY PLEADINGS AND
ORDERS.

03/26/13 DJSCH ATTEND COURT-ORDERED MEDIATION AND MEETINGS WITH PARTIES 7.00
DURING SAME (6.5), BARON LIVING EXPENSES PAYMENT (.2 NC) AND
MULTIPLE NEW UDRP CLAIMS (.5).

03/27/13 CDKR  CONFERENCE WITH MR. FINE AND MR. SCHENCK REGARDING POSSIBLE 0.70
SETTLEMENT (NC). CALL WITH MR. VOGEL REGARDING SAME (NC).
CONFERENCE CALL WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL REGARDING SAME (.7).

03/27/13 DISCH CALLS WITH BARON’S COUNSEL AND WITH P. VOGEL RE: PROPOSAL TO 2.50
SETTLE FROM PROCEEDS IN ONDOVA (1.0), RECEIVE AND REVIEW
TRANSCRIPT AND ORDER FROM 2010 PLACING BARON FUNDS INTO ONDOVA
(.5), CALL WITH STEVE LIEBERMAN RE: INTEREST IN SALE AND HIS RECENT
COMMUNICATIONS WITH MR. URBANIK (1.0).

03/27/13 JRF EMAIL TRAFFIC REGARDING VARIOUS OFFERS FROM AND TO STEVAN 0.70
LIEBERMAN AND URBANIK RE SELLING DISCRETE NAMES (.7).

03/28/13 ALP OFFICE CONFERENCES WITH DAVID SCHENCK REGARDING ORDERING 12/14/12 0.50
HEARING TRANSCRIPT RE: NETSPHERE V. BARON (USDC CASE) (.1);
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH COURT REPORTER CHARYCE CRAWFORD
REGARDING SAME (.1); RESEARCHED PACER REGARDING SAME (.3).

03/28/13 CDKR  CONFERENCE CALLS TO FOLLOW UP ON AND COMPLETE COURT-ORDERED 2.00
MANDATORY SETTLEMENT NEGOTIATIONS (2.0). REVIEW OF CASE STATUS
AND STRATEGY WITH MR. FINE AND MR. SCHENCK (.5 NC).

03/28/13 DJSCH BARON MOTIONS FOR FEES AND RETAINERS (1.0), CALLS WITH P. VOGEL RE 3.50
SAME (.3), CALL WITH R. URBANIK RE: SETTLEMENT (.4), CALL WITH R.
ROBERSON RE: SAME (.3), CALLS WITH M. STROMBERG RE: SAME, CALLS
WITH CLIENT RE: SETTLEMENT AND POSSIBLE RESPONSE TO FEE MOTION
(ABATED PENDING HEARING) (.5); REVISE AND EDIT COMPLETE JANUARY
BILL (1.0); MEETING WITH MS. PARNELL (NC).
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PAGE NO. 9
DATE ID  DESCRIPTION HOURS
03/28/13 JRF  VERY EXTENDED NEGOTIATING CALLS WITH MARK STROMBERG (1.0), PETER 5.30

VOGEL (.4), RICH ROBERSON (.3), STEVAN LIEBERMAN RE CASE STATUS AND
.8), RAY URBANIK (.5) RE

FORWARD TO DAVID SCHENCK THE
AND REVIEW SAME (1.5). REVIEW

AND FORWARD PLEADINGS FILED BY BARON IN VARIOUS COURTS (.8).

03/29/13 ALP DRAFTED LETTER TO COURT REPORTER REGARDING 12/14/12 HEARING 0.30
TRANSCRIPT.

03/29/13 CDKR  RECEIVED AND REVIEWED NETSPHERE’S RESPONSE IN OPPOSITION TO 0.50
MOTION FOR ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE (.3). OUTLINING OF REPLY TO SAME (.2).

03/29/13 DISCH REVIEW NETSPHERE RESPONSE AND DISCUSS SAME WITH P. VOGEL. 0.50

03/29/13 DIJSCH CALL WITH P. VOGEL RE: SETTLEMENT STATUS AND MOTIONS RE: FEES. 0.50

03/29/13 JRF EXTENDED CALL WITH PETER VOGEL RE SETTLEMENT STATUS AND 0.40

RELATED MATTERS (4).

TOTAL ATTORNEY & PARALEGAL TIME .ccoummmrenmmmenmemimsmvssursmsummmemsnmmmosssnniyssnsyssns 229.90
TOTAL LEGAL FEES....cuaisaussuissisisusoiasossconiysouss b sosshesn s sionsnsssiliyassssimeass seimgans o eeee s $ 112,864.00
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PAGE NO. 10

03/28/13

02/20/13

02/21/13

03/18/13

DISBURSEMENTS

COURT REPORTING SERVICES - CHARYSE CRAWFORD
VOGEL TRANSCRIPT OF 12/14/12 HEARING (NETSPHERE
USDC CASE)

BANK OF AMERICA BANKCARD - IN REFERENCE TO :
JEFFREY BARON

BANK OF AMERICA BANKCARD - HEARING
TRANSCRIPT

TRAVEL-EXCEPT AIRFARE, HOTEL & MEALS - JEFFREY
R. FINE PARKING AT COURTHOUSE

PHOTOCOPY EXPENSES
SCANNING EXPENSES

PRINTING EXPENSES

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS .....coccoiimvmnmrenninimiennss

NOTE: INCURRED DISBURSEMENTS NOT APPEARING
ON THIS INVOICE WILL BE BILLED LATER.

255.00

629.20
160.80
10.00

59.20
82.40

388.80

$ 1,585.40
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BILLING SUMMARY

D TIMEKEEPER HOURS RATE AMOUNT
JRF JEFFREY R. FINE - 53.00 560.00 29,680.00
CDKR  CHRISTOPHER D. KRATOVIL 49.50 505.00 24,997.50
DISCH DAVID J. SCHENCK 78.10 570.00 44,517.00
WBF WILLIAM B. FINKELSTEIN 4.00 620.00 2,480.00
ARA ALISON R. ASHMORE 6.40 320.00 2,048.00
ALP ALEXA L. PARNELL 38.90 235.00 9,141.50
TOTAL 229.90 112,864.00
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BARON RECEIVERSHIP MATTERS
APRIL 8, 2013 INVOICE NO. 1507990
PAGE NO. 12
==t $ 112,864.00
DISBURSEMENTS .o 1,585.40
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE cooooooeeoeoeeseseeosssesssssssessssanns $_ 114,449.40
DyYKeMAGOSSET Truc

DYKEMA GOSSETT PLLC
DEPT CH 16382
PALATINE, IL 60055-6382

CLIENT CHECK INFORMATION
PLEASE COMPLETE:
THIS INVOICE IS PAYABLE UPON RECEIPT.

CIHECK#: DATE: AMOUNT:
PLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR REMITTANCE.

FOR FIRM USE:

RECEIVED DATE:
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Jeffrey R. Fine works with clients to resolve complex business issues, focusing on insolvency,
bankruptcy and creditor workout areas. He has wide experience in foreclosure and loan workout
matters, and he advises lenders and servicers on a wide array of bankruptcy issues ranging from
consumer chapter 7 and 13 matters to business bankruptcy matters. He also appears frequently in
complex Chapter 11 cases representing creditors, debtors and creditor committees. Mr. Fine combines
litigation skills and a wealth of diverse experience to represent clients throughout the United States.

Prior to joining Dykema, Mr. Fine was a partner at K & L Gates in Dallas, Texas.
Experience

e Lender representation in the workout and bankruptcies of troubled secured real estate and
unsecured consumer loan portfolios involving Chapter 7 and 13 filings, out of court loan
modifications, and foreclosures

e Lender representation in the workout, bankruptcy and/or foreclosure of more than $1 billion in
secured commercial real estate loans in multiple jurisdictions

e Lead attorney, Unsecured Creditors' Committee in the Texas Rangers Baseball Partners
Chapter 11, with 100% payout, plus interest to unsecured creditors.

e Lead counsel for QSR and specialty lender servicers in distressed portfolio workouts,
foreclosures and bankruptcies

e Lead counsel to consortium of corporations regarding environmental issues in complex
environmental services Chapter 11 cases.

e Lead bankruptcy counsel to large environmental trusts

e Lead counsel to liquidating trust asserting complex breach of multiple duties of loyalty of
officers and directors of former Chapter 11 debtors

e Lead counsel in the successful Chapter 11 reorganization of the second largest vinyl and
aluminum window manufacturer in the United States

e Lead counsel in the successful Chapter 11 reorganization of a VOIP telecommunications
company

e Lead counsel in the successful Chapter 11 reorganization of the largest independent bookstore
chain in the Southwest

e Litigated and successfully settled antitrust claims against more than 18 booksellers, including
major publishing houses and a national bookstore chain

e Team member in the successful Chapter 11 reorganization of a major cargo and charter
passenger airline

e Counsel to airports in more than 25 airline bankruptcies. Lead counsel working in conjunction
with the United States Department of Transportation on Passenger Facility Charge litigation on
behalf of various airports in airline bankruptcy cases nationwide

o Nationwide representation of various equipment lessors in complex Chapter 11 cases

13-10696.27850
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e Nationwide representation of various truck manufacturers in dealer bankruptcy and workout
matters

Significant Decisions

e In the Matter of Hargis (Palmer & Palmer, P.C. v. United States Trustee), 887 F.2d 77 (5th Cir.
1989), Transfers made to prepetition creditors out of non estate assets may not be avoided

e In the Matter of Hargis (Palmer & Palmer, P.C. v. United States Trustee), 895 F.2d 1025 (5th
Cir. 1990), Bankruptcy Code Section 329 does not apply to services which were unrelated to
bankruptcy proceeding

e In re Altman Nursing, Inc. (Clay Capital Corp. v. Gerrit M. Pronske), 299 B.R. 813 (Bankr.
N.D.Tex. 2003) Order Affirmed at 306 B.R. 854 (N.D.Tex. 2004) Vacated and Remanded by In
re Altman Nursing, Inc. 121 Fed.Appx. 56 (5th Cir. 2005), Contest between claimant and its
counsel regarding rights to attorney fees in Chapter 7 case

e Inre Susan R. Miles (MAXIM Healthcare Services, Inc. v. Susan R. Miles), 2005 WL 1981040
(N.D.Tex.), Finality of bankruptcy court order and jurisdiction to hear appeal in Chapter 13
case

e In re Financial Corporation of America, 119 B.R. 728 (Bankr. C.D.Cal. 1990), Scope of Rule
2004 discovery by Chapter 7 trustee of 70,000 boxes of bank records

e Inre Avado Brands, Inc. (William Kaye v. Thomas E. Dupree), 358 B.R. 868 (Bankr. N.D.Tex.
2006), Analysis of bankruptcy court's subject matter jurisdiction over post-confirmation
proceedings

e Thomas E. DuPree v. William Kaye, et al., 2008 WL 294532 (N.D.Tex), Analysis of standards
to permit an appeal under Section 1292(b)

e In re DataVoN, Inc., 303 B.R. 119 (Bankr. N.D.Tex. 2003), Analysis of what constitutes
"substantial contribution" in a Chapter 11 case

e In re Midway Airlines, Inc. (Sheldon L. Solow v. Dallas/Fort Worth International Airport), 1994
WL 197480 (Bankr. N.D. IIl.), Analysis of standard for permitting leave to amend complaint
under Rule 7015

e In re Coleman Pipe, Inc., 40 B.R. 338 (Bankr. N.D.Tex. 1984), Analysis of extent of creditor's
security interest in light of draw on letter of credit

e In re The Seasons Apartments, Limited Partnership, 215 B.R. 953 (Bankr. W.D.La.
1997), Analysis of whether claims are unimpaired for plan confirmation purposes

e In re Gulf Coast Holdings, Inc. d/b/a Unidynamics, Inc., 2007 WL 1340802 (Bankr.
N.D.Tex.), Plan confirmation issues

Seminars and Speeches

e 2011 Tousa's Impact on Fee Disgorgement, Fee Shifting, and Other Lawyer
Nightmares, Article and ethics seminar presentation, American Bankruptcy Institute Spring
Meeting

e 2006 Property Portability and Taxability Issues, 20th Annual Legal Seminar on Ad Valorem
Taxation, State Bar of Texas

13-10696.27851


13-10696.27851


Case 3:09-cv-00988-L Document 1234-9 Filed 04/17/13 Page 4 of 12 PagelD 63491

e 2003 Airline Bankruptcy - Major Issues Confronting the Industry, Webcast and seminar
presentation, American Association of Airport Executives

e 2001 Foreclosure Practice, State Bar of Texas Advanced Real Estate Short Course
e 2001 Bankruptcy -- What Every Aviation Lawyer Should Know, ABA Air & Space Law Forum

e 1999 Enforcement Issues Concerning Passenger Facility Charges, American Association of
Airport Executives (AAAE) Training Institute, Palm Springs, California

e 1995 Bankruptcy Litigation Ethics, Norton Bankruptcy Litigation Institute, Las Vegas, Nevada
Professional Associations

e Master, John C. Ford Inn of Court

e Dallas Bar Association - Business Law Section - Business Bankruptcy

e American Bankruptcy Institute

e Northern District of Texas, Criminal Justice Act Panel

Civic and Cultural Involvements
Mr. Fine is a member of a number of non-profit boards
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DAVID JOHN SCHENCK
6239 Lupton Drive
Dallas, Texas 75225
(214) 533-9353
EXPERIENCE
DEPUTY ATTORNEY GENERAL FOR LEGAL COUNSEL— Austin, Texas (2010-12)

PagelD 63492

Chief Legal Counsel to the Attorney General, Responsible for Management of Opinions, Public Finance, General

Counsel, Grants Administration, and Legal, Technical Support Divisions.

JONES DAY — Washington, D.C. & Dallas, Texas (2004-10)

Partner, Primarily Responsible for Texas I ssues and Appeals Practice Group (2004 - 10) Associate D.C. (1993-95).

COMMISSIONER, TEXAS LOTTERY COMMISSION (2007-10)

Appointed by Gov. Perry to Supervise and Regulate Operations of State Lottery and Charitable Bingo.

HUGHES & Luce — Dallas, Texas (1995-2004)
Litigation Associate (1995-2000), Partner (2000-04), Appellate Section Head (2001-04).

SOUTHERN METHODIST UNIVERSITY LAW ScHooL — Dallas, Texas
Adjunct Professor, Legal Research & Writing (1995-1998)

HONORABLE HENRY PoLITZ, CHIEF JUDGE U.S. COURT OF APPEALS, FIFTH CIRCUIT.
Law Clerk (1992-93)

HONORABLE WALTER SMITH, U.S. DISTRICT JUDGE, WESTERN DIST. OF TEXAS
Judicial Intern (1991)

PROFESSIONAL AWARDSAND ACTIVITIES
BOARD CERTIFIED IN CIVIL APPELLATE LAW -- Texas Board of Legal Specialization
TEXAS" SUPERLAWYERS’ TEXAS MONTHLY MAGAZINE, APPELLATE
“AV” RATED MARTINDALE HUBBELL
OUTSTANDING LEAD ARTICLE, TEXAS TECH LAW REVIEW 2009
RECOGNITION UPON ADMISSION, Second Highest Score on Texas Bar Exam 1992
STATE BAR OF TEXAS, President’s Award 1998
TEXAS EQUAL ACCESS TO JUSTICE COMMISSION, Stars of Justice Award 2003
DALLASVOLUNTEER ATTORNEY S PROGRAM, Special Service Award 2003
FIFTH CIRCUIT RULES ADVISORY COMMITTEE, Representative from Texas (2003-06)
TEXAS STATE RIFE ASSOCIATION, Specia Service Award 2000, 2007
BARRISTER, PATRICK HIGGINBOTHAM INN OF COURT, 2004-2006

EDUCATION

BAYLOR UNIVERSITY SCHOOL OF LAW— Waco, Texas

Juris Doctor (with highest honors) (Feb. 1992)
Editor-in-Chief, Baylor Law Review
Vaedictorian

Highest Grade in Nine Subjects and Outstanding Student Awards in Property, Torts, Civil Procedure, Remedies,

Evidence and Others

Fulbright & Jaworski Outstanding First Year Student Award
Vinson & Elkins Full Academic Scholarship

National & Baylor Order of Barristers & Member

TYLA Interscholastic Moot Court Team

STATE UNIVERSITY OF NEW Y ORK-ALBANY—NELSON ROCKEFELLER COLLEGE OF PUBLIC AFFAIRS & PoLICY
Bachelor of Arts (magna cum laude) in Criminal Justice, Economics and Philosophy (Dec. 1989)

First Place, ABA National Writing Competition
Alpha Phi SigmaHonor Society

DALLAS\512677.1
ID\DJSCH - 108946\0001
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PUBLICATIONS

Remedies for Environmental Liability: Rights of the Toxic Grantee, 43 BAYLOR L. Rev. (1991)

Reasonable Accommodation of the Disabled Worker - A Job for the Man or a Man for the Job, 44 BAYLOR L. REV. (1992)
Exceptions to Chevron, Administrative Law News (Jan. 1993)

The King Has Been Known to Err: Satterfield & Pontikes Congt. v. Irving I.S.D., TEXAS SCHOOL LAW REPORT (2004)
Escape From New York: Tennessee Telecommuters Due Process Challenge To New York Income Taxes Will Not Be Heard
By The Supreme Court (2005)

What Part Of "In Michigan" Do You Not Understand? Michigan Court Of Appeals Rejects Attempt To Impose Use Tax On
Bowling Balls Used Outside Of Michigan, Jones Day Sate Tax Return (2005)

Technical "Foot Fault" Over The Commerce Clause Line May Cost The Texas Comptroller Big Time -- Texas " Throwback
Provision" Sruck Down As Unduly Burdening Interstate Commerce As Applied, Even Though No Real Additional Burden
Was Shown, Jones Day State Tax Return (2005)

Are We Finally Ready to Reshape Texas Appellate Courts for the 21st Century? 41 TEXAS TECH. L. REV. 221 (2009)
Litigation With the Sovereign in Texas 61 THE ADOVCATE (2012)

ADMISSIONS
Texas (1992); District of Columbia (1994); United States Courts of Appeals for the First, Fourth, Fifth, Tenth, Eleventh and
D.C. Circuits; United States Supreme Court and U.S. Court of International Trade.

REPRESENTATIONS
Perez v. Perry, No. SA-11-CA-360 (W.D. Tex. 2011-) & Texasv. United Sates, No. 1:11-CV-01303 (D.D.C. 2011-12). Lead
Counsel for Texas & Gov. Perry in three judge panel redistricting cases under Sections 2 and 5 of the Voting Rights Act.

Abbott v. United Sates, 131 S. Ct. 18 (2010). Co-counsel to Petitioner in federal sentencing/ statutory construction matter.

Verizon v. 2020 Live Oak, Dallas County (2009). Lead counsel to Verizon in significant real estate lease dispute; obtained
preliminary injunction prior to settlement.

InreLennar, No. 07-0024 (Tex. 2007). Lead counsel to Lennar in mandamus proceeding to foreclose pre-suit discovery
pending administrative exhaustion. Case settled following Supreme Court’s order granting stay and requesting merits briefs.

Heller v. District of Columbia, No. 07-290, 554 U.S. 570 (2008). Amicus brief on behalf of forty state rifle and pistol
associations urging confirmation of an individual right under Second Amendment to U.S. Constitution.

In re Child Protective Services, 255 S.W.3d 618 (Tex. 2008). Successful pursuit of mandamus relief on behalf of FLDS
mothers separated from their children following a highly-publicized raid on their west Texas ranch.

United Sates ex. rel Gudur v. Delloite & Touche, 2008 WL 3244000 (5th Cir. 2008). Argued successfully in defense of
summary judgment dismissal of multi-billion dollar qui tam suit.

Rogersv. McDorman, 521 F.3d 381 (5th Cir. 2008). Successful defense of judgment incorporating in pari delicto defense
into the civil RICO statute.

In re Volkswagen, 371 F.3d 201 (5th Cir. 2004). Successful petition for writ of mandamus from order denying 28 U.S.C. §
1404(a) motion to transfer venue.

Wen Ho Leev. U.S Dep't of Justice, 413 F.3d 53 (D.C.Cir. 2006). Obtained affirmance of contempt findings for unlawful and
harmful leaks disseminated to the mediaby U.S. officials, in violation of the Privacy Act, and secured alandmark settlement
in conjunction with denial of Supreme Court review for former nuclear physicist at Los Alamos National Laboratory.

Ballard v. Commissioner, 544 U.S. 40 (2005). Successful petition to U.S. Supreme Court of decision denying taxpayers
access to original decision of trial judgein U.S. Tax Court. Following reversal, the record was supplemented to confirm an
off-the-record reversal of trial judge's origina determination in favor of taxpayer.

DALLAS\512677.1
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Grande Communications v. Verizon, No. 2006-30206-11 (211th Dist. Ct. Denton County, Tex. 2007). Set aside temporary
restraining order and defeated action brought by competing carrier to bar Verizon's accessin new development by purported
exclusive easements with devel opers.

Texas Equal Accessv. Washington Legal Fndn., 524 U.S. 156 (1998) (Petitioner's Counsel); Phillips v. Washington Legal
Fndn., 123 S.Ct 1654 (2003) (Petitioner's Counsel); Brown v. Washington Legal Fndn., 538 U.S. 216 (2003) (Counsel for TX
Sup. Ct./Jamicus). Successful defense of challenge to the constitutionality of the Texas IOLTA program and like programsin
50 states.

John v. Marshall Health Services, 58 SW.3d 738 (Tex. 2001), 91 SW.3d 44 (Tex. App. - Texarkana 2002, pet. denied) (on
remand). Petition to Texas Supreme Court following dismissal of trial counsel's appeal as untimely. The Petition was granted,
the appeal was reinstated and the trial court's judgment was reversed after oral argument on remand.

CoServ v. Southwestern Bell, 2003 WL 22514907 (5th Cir. 2003). Successful appellate representation in case presenting
complex jurisdictional questions under the Federal Telecommunications Act affecting state commission authority to arbitrate
interconnection arrangements.

Southwestern Bell v. City of El Paso, 346 F.3d 541 (5th Cir. 2003). Successful appellate representation in case opposing local
governmental agency’ s attempt to impose afee on utilities for crossing the agency’ s property.

In re Altman Nursing, 121 Fed. App’x 56 (5th Cir. 2005). Secured reversal and remand of complex bankruptcy matter on
behalf of creditor whose sizeable secured interest had been acquired by his own counsel at auction after withdrawal.

Northrup v. Southwestern Bell, 72 S.W.3d 16 (Tex. App. —Corpus Christi 2002, pet. denied). Successful appellate defense of
first ever cy pres class action settlement in Texas.

Supreme Beef v. Maddox, 67 S.W.3d 453 (Tex. App.—Texarkana 2002, pet. denied). Wrote Appellants' briefs urging
reversal of Plaintiff’s verdict based on error in jury instructions prior to withdrawal of firm. The court reversed without
argument.

Southwestern Bell v. El Paso County Water Imp. Dist., 243 F.3d 936 (5th Cir. 2001). Successful appellate representation in
case involving immunity from suit of Texas political subdivision.

AT&T v. City of Dallas, 243 F.3d 928 (5th Cir. 2001). Successful appeal of case concerning competitive neutrality among
competing local telephone service providers.

Soinal Concepts v. Curasan, 2006 WL 2577820 (N.D. Tex. 2006). Secured reversal in substantial part of arbitration award.

Marathon Qil Co. v. Ruhrgas, 115 F.3d 315 (5th Cir. 1997), 182 F.3d 291 (5th Cir. 1999) (en banc), rev'd, 526 U.S. 574
(1999). Thisinternational oil and gas controversy presented numerous issues relating to the funding and development of
North Sea gas production infrastructure. Argued successfully to the panel and the en banc Fifth Circuit and appeared on the
briefsin the U.S. Supreme Court.

Humphrey v. Cain, 120 F.3d 526 (5th Cir. 1997), 138 F.3d 552 (5th Cir. 1998) (en banc), cert. denied, 525 U.S. 935 (1998).
Appointed representation on behalf of a Louisianainmate serving life at hard labor without possibility of parole. The Court en
banc agreed that the instruction of reasonable doubt denied due process and granted habeas corpus relief.

In re Policy Management Systems Corp., 23 Media L. Rptr. 2486 (4th Cir. 1994). Successful appellate representation urging
reversal of district court order releasing to press certain court filings under First Amendment.

United We Stand America, Inc. v. United We Stand America New York, Inc., 128 F.3d 86 (2d Cir. 1997). Successful appellate
representation urging affirmance of Lanham Act coverage of trademark (and rejection of First Amendment attack) in the
name of a political party, notwithstanding noncommercial use of the name.

Testmasters Educational Servicesv. Sngh, 64 U.S.P.Q.2d 1469 (5th Cir. 2002). Set aside jury finding of common-law
trademark infringement judgment and secured invalidation of opponent's trademark in cross appeal.
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ID\DJSCH - 108946\0001

13-10696.27855


13-10696.27855


Case 3:09-cv-00988-L Document 1234-9 Filed 04/17/13 Page 8 of 12 PagelD 63495

United States v. Emerson, 270 F.3d 230 (5th Cir. 2001). Counsel for amici Texas State Rifle Association. Filed brief urging
recognition of individual right under the Second Amendment.

QuestMedical v. Appril, 90 F.3d 1080 (5th Cir. 1996). Wrote brief persuading Fifth Circuit to uphold complex election of
remedy decision.

Michael Irvin, et al. v. KXAS, et al., obtained dismissal without participation in settlement on behalf of television news
reporter in connection with highly-publicized libel action brought by Dallas Cowboys football players against station and
reporter.
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Christopher D.
Kratovil

Member

Dallas
Comerica Bank Tower
1717 Main Street

| Suite 4000

I T: 214-462-6458 ckratovil@dykema.com
Areas Of Practice

Appellate

Christopher D. Kratovil is a member of Dykema’s Litigation practice in the

Firm’s Dallas office. Prior to joining Dykema, Mr. Kratovil was a partner at

Business & Commercial K&L Gates. Mr. Kratovil is a former law clerk to the Honorable Edith H.

Litigation \(J:Qnei, Chief Judge of the United States Court of Appeals for the Fifth
ircuit.

Class Action Defense

White-Collar Criminal Defense &

Internal Investigations Mr. Kratovil focuses his practice on appellate matters, representing clients
in complex commercial disputes before tribunals ranging from small town
Texas trial courts to the U.S. Supreme Court, with a particular
concentration on matters in the U.S. Court of Appeals for the Fifth Circuit

Bar Admissions

Texas and in the Texas courts of appeals. He has considerable experience in
federal and state mandamus practice, including serving as the lead
Court Admissions draftsman of the winning briefs in the landmark Fifth Circuit case that

US.S Court authorized the use of mandamus to compel convenience-based venue
-5. Supreme Lou transfers, In re Volkswagen II, 545 F.3d 304 (5th Cir. 2008)(en banc).
U.S. Court of Appeals, 2nd Circuit

U.S. Court of Appeals, 5th Gircuit In addition to his extensive appellate work, Mr. Kratovil regularly handles

case dispositive briefing and argument, jury charges, complex motions,

U.S. Court of Appeals, 11th Circuit research intensive legal issues and error preservation in the trial courts. He
U.S. District Court, Eastern District also regularly assists in the white collar defense of clients accused of
of Texas financial, securities and tax crimes. Mr. Kratovil is the author of several

high-profile amicus curiae briefs, including on behalf United States
Senator John Cornyn and, separately, for the Texas state representative
who sponsored the so-called “Pole Tax” user fee on patrons of adult
U.S. District Court, Southern entertainment.

District of Texas

U.S. District Court, Western
District of Texas

U.S. District Court, Northern
District of Texas

A frequent author and lecturer, Mr. Kratovil earned a B.A. magna cum
laude from University of Notre Dame and a J.D. with honors from
University of Texas at Austin School of Law, where he was an editor of the

U.S. District Court, Eastern District Texas Law Review. He has been recognized repeatedly as a “Rising Star”
of Arkansas by Texas Monthly and was recently named one of the “Best Lawyers in
U.S. District Court, Western Dallas” by D Magazine.

District of Arkansas

U. S. District Court for the District Experience

of Nebraska
e Primary draftsman of briefs in a victory before the U. S. Supreme Court

on behalf of taxpayers challenging the legality of secretive procedures
Education used by the U.S. Tax Court, Ballard v. Commissioner of Internal
University of Texas at Austin, J.D. Revenue, 544 U.S. 40 (2005).

* Primary author of winning briefs to the en banc Fifth Circuit in that
court's leading decision on venue transfers under 28 U.S.C. § 1404(a),
resulting in the issuance of a writ of mandamus against the United
States District Court for the Eastern District of Texas. In re Volkswagen
Il, 545 F. 3d 304 (5th Cir. 2008) (en banc).

e with honors
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Christopher D. Kratovil (Cont.)

e QOrder of the Coif

e |aw Review, Administrative
Editor

University of Notre Dame, B.A,,
magna cum laude

Dykema

Lead Counsel in successful effort to prevent the confirmation and
enforcement of a $27 million arbitration award against a foreign utility
company in federal district court.

Lead appellate counsel for one of the nation's largest defense
contractors in a dispute with a major union concerning the interpretation
and application of the parties' collective bargaining agreement,
ultimately resulting in a victory for the defense contractor in the Fifth
Circuit.

Co-lead counsel in obtaining the dismissal in federal district court of a
$25 million fraud and breach of fiduciary duty lawsuit against a major
national law firm.

Assisted with successful petition for writ of mandamus in the United
States Court of Appeals for the Federal Circuit, resulting in the issuance
of a writ of mandamus against the United States District Court for the
Eastern District of Texas on a venue issue in a patent case.

Lead counsel in the preparation and filing of an amicus curiae brief with
the Texas Supreme Court on behalf of a United States Senator.

Lead counsel in preparation and filing amicus curiae brief in the Texas
Supreme Court on behalf of a Texas Representative and a state
association.

Prepared winning briefs to the Supreme Court of Texas on behalf of a
policy holder in a commercial insurance coverage dispute.

Lead counsel in obtaining set-aside of seven-figure default judgment in
multi-tiered complex commercial proceedings involving Texas, federal
and bankruptcy procedural law issues.

Co-counsel in preparation of amicus curiae brief on behalf of law
professors in the first major piece of "global warming litigation" heard by
the Supreme Court of the United States.

Primary draftsman of winning briefs to the Fifth Circuit in a trademark
case concerning the attemted re-litigation of "secondary meaning" of a
descriptive trademark.

Author of prevailing briefs to the Fifth Circuit on behalf of appellant
taxpayers accused of engaging in elaborate civil tax fraud and "kick-
back" scheme.

Obtained certification of a novel question of Texas Insurance law from
the Fifth Circuit to the Supreme Court of Texas.

Author of briefs to the Fifth Circuit resulting in reversal of the trial court's
grant of judgment notwithstanding the verdict in a precedent-setting
multimillion dollar age discrimination lawsuit.

Assisted with briefing in the Fifth Circuit in an appeal resulting in the
reversal of a jury verdict based on cumulative evidentiary errors by the
trial judge.

Obtained reversal from the Dallas Court of Appeals of a grant of
summary judgment in UCC Article 9 foreclosure appeal.

As appellate counsel, preserved a favorable class-action settlement
against appellate challenges brought by multiple dissatisfied class
members in the Texas Supreme Court.

As trial counsel in an appointed federal criminal case, achieved the
partial acquittal of an inmate who had allegedly escaped from
incarceration and assaulted armed guards.
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Dykema

Christopher D. Kratovil (Cont.)

In The News

Kratovil Quoted in Texas Lawyer Article—What “Conservative” Means in State Judiciary
June 5, 2012

Three Dykema Lawyers Named to D Magazine’s “Best Lawyers in Dallas”
May 24, 2012

Kratovil Delivers Podcast—Discusses Significance of Marmet Decision
March 12, 2012

Seminars & Speeches

Marmet Health Care Center, Inc. v. Brown— Post-Decision, SCOTUScast, Federalist Society
March 12, 2012

Litigation in the U. S. Federal System, A delegation of Visiting Lawyers from Vietnam's Ministry of Justice
March 4, 2011

The Fraud Exception, Panel presentation to the Mergers & Acquisitions Section of the Dallas Bar Association
December 12, 2010

Mandamus Practice in the Fifth Circuit, presented to the Appellate Section of the Dallas Bar Association
June 17, 2010

Federal Mandamus and the East Texas Venue Wars, presented to the Appellate Section of the San Antonio Bar Association
February 18, 2010

Perfecting the Appeal and Securing the Record, presented to the State Bar of Texas Appellate Section "Boot Camp" CLE
September 9, 2009

A Look Ahead: The Next Year at the Supreme Court of Texas, presented to the Dallas Lawyers' Chapter of the Federalist
Society
October 16, 2008

Recent Developments in Arbitration, presented to the 18th Annual University of Texas Conference on Federal and State
Appeals
May 30, 2008

Challenging Arbitration Awards, presented to the Appellate Section of the El Paso Bar Association
April 18, 2007

Challenging Arbitration Awards, presented to the Appellate Section of the San Antonio Bar Association
April 11, 2007

Appellate Options After Arbitration, presented to the Appellate Section of the Dallas Bar Association
March 16, 2007

Reducing the 'Daunting Finality' of Arbitration Awards: Crafting an Appellate Option, North Dallas Bar CLE Clinic
January 2007

Everyday rules for Better Legal Writing, presented to the Dallas Area Paralegal Association
May 10, 2006

Enhancing Your Appellate Prospects, moderator of panel presentation to the Dallas Bar Association CLE Clinic
May 5, 2006

Appellate Options from Arbitration Awards, presented to the Appellate Section of the Houston Bar Association
April 19, 2006

Choosing the Right Legal Career Path For You, presented to Phi Alpha Delta chapter at Texas Tech University Law School
April 5, 2006
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Dykema

Christopher D. Kratovil (Cont.)

Challenging Arbitration Awards: A Role for the Courts, presented to the Judiciary Committee of the Dallas Bar Association
February 9, 2006

Reducing the 'Daunting Finality' of Arbitration Awards: Crafting an Appellate Option, presented to the Appellate Law Section
of the Dallas Bar Association
January 18, 2006

Injunctions and Temporary Restraining Orders, presented to the Trial Skills Section of the Dallas Bar Association
December 8, 2004

Memberships & Involvement

e Dallas Bar Association

* Business Litigation Section of the Dallas Bar Association, Council Member, 2009, Treasurer, 2010; Secretary, 2011
o State Bar of Texas Appellate Section, Co-Chair of the Corporate Counsel Committee, 2010-2011

e Higginbotham Inn of Court, Associate, 2005-2006

» Dallas Association of Young Lawyers, Leadership Class, 2003

» Dallas Volunteer Attorney Program Volunteer

Community/Civic Activities

e Cisterclan Preparatory School Alumni Association, Board of Directors, President, 2007-2008
e Lamplighter School Alumni Council, 2005-2008

* Notre Dame Alumni Club of Dallas

e Texas Law Review Association, Former managing director, 1999-2000

e Leadership Las Colinas-Irving Class of 2008

* College of the State Bar of Texas

Awards & Recognition

* Named a "Best Lawyer in Dallas" by D-Magazine, 2011-2012
* Named a "Rising Star" by Law & Politics, 2007-2013

Press Releases

Kratovil Joins Dykema In Dallas
July 14, 2011
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INTHE UNITED STATESDISTRICT COURT
FOR THE NORTHERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS
DALLASDIVISION

NETSPHERE, INC.,
MANILA INDUSTRIES, INC., AND
MUNISH KRISHAN

PLAINTIFFS,

vV CIVIL ACTION NO. 3:09-CV-0988-F

JEFFREY BARON AND ONDOVA
LIMITED COMPANY,

w W W W W N W W W W W LN

DEFENDANTS.

CERTIFICATE OF CONFERENCE TO ACCOMPANY
MOTION TO QUASH (DOCKET # 1226)

Prior to filing the Motion to Quash counsel for the Receiver conferred with counsel for
the Trustee and offered to make the Receiver available for a brief deposition voluntarily,
notwithstanding the lack of any currently authorized discovery, provided the Trustee would aso
agree to provide any written documentation in support of his clam to payment from the
Receivership in advance of said deposition. Counsd for the Trustee indicated that the
documentation was too extensive to permit such a production. Thus, the parties were unable to
agree on the relief requested in the Motion to Quash.

Respectfully submitted,
DYKEMA GOSSETT PLLC

By: /¢ David J. Schenck
David J. Schenck

State Bar No. 17736870
Jeffrey R. Fine

State Bar No. 07008410
Christopher D. Kratovil
State Bar No. 24027427
1717 Main Street, Suite 4000
Dallas, Texas 75201

(214) 462-6455

(214) 462-6401 (Telecopier)

ATTORNEYSFOR THE RECEIVER, PETER S.
VOGEL

CERTIFICATE OF CONFERENCE TO ACCOMPANY M OTION TO QUASH (DOCKET # 1226) PAGE 1
DALLAS\511487.2
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CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE

| hereby certify that atrue and correct copy of the foregoing document was served viathe
Court’s ECF system on al counsel of record on April 18, 2013.

By: /¢ David J. Schenck
David J. Schenck

CERTIFICATE OF CONFERENCE TO ACCOMPANY M OTION TO QUASH (DOCKET # 1226) PAGE 2
DALLAS\511487.2
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S U.S. DISTRICT COURT
- NORTHERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS _ |
IN THE UNITED STATES DISTRICT CQURT FILED o
FOR THE NORTHERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS
DALLAS DIVISION APR 18 2013
NETSPHERE, INC,, §
MANILA INDUSTRIES, INC., AND § CLERK. U.S -
MUNISH KRISHAN § By o Ul ICT COURT
§ "Deputy j,45p.71
PLAINTIFFS, §
§
V. § CIVIL ACTION NO. 3:09-CV-0988-F
§
JEFFREY BARON AND §
ONDOVA LIMITED COMPANY, §
§
DEFENDANTS. §

ORDER DENYING MOTION TO SET DATES FOR SUBMISSION OF FEE
APPLICATIONS FOR JEFFREY BARON

BEFORE THE COURT is Jeffrey Baron’s Motion to Set Dates for Submission of Fee
Applications for Jeffrey Baron or for Other Appropriate Relief and Request for Expedited Ruling
Thereon, filed April 17, 2013 (Docket No. 1231). Jeffrey Baron and his counsel ask the Court to
set a deadline for Baron’s counsel to submit fee applications and requests for retainers for the
past and continued representation of Jeffrey Baron in the above-numbered case. The Court is of
the dpinion that this Motion should be DENIED.!

On April 5, 2013, following a joint-status conference, the Bankruptcy Court entered a
Sua Sponte Order Modifying Automatic Stay (Section 362) to Permit Adjudication of Allowable
Receivership Fees and Expenses in District Court (Bankruptcy Case No. 12-37921-SGJ-7,
Docket No. 115). This narrow order modified the stay to allow this Court to determine the
reasonable administrative receivership fees and experises in accordance with the Fifth Circuit
opinion. The Order did not lift the stay to allow this Court to pay Mr. Baron’s counsel for

services already rendered nor did it lift the stay to allow this Court to resolve pending matters

! This resolves Docket No. 1231.

13-10696.27863
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requesting retainers for Mr. Baron’s current counsel. Accordingly, the Court will not entertain
fee applications from any of Mr. Baron’s former or current attorneys as their claims remain
properly with the Bankruptcy Court. Mr. Baron may respond to all fee applications submitted by
the Receiver and his counsel, but may not submit his own fee applications at this time.

The Court reminds all parties that its rulings on the receivership fees and expenses will
not go into effect immediately. None of these claims will be paid until the Bankruptcy Court
rules whether the involuntary bankruptcy is proper. At this time, depending on whether an order
for relief is entered or not, the Bankruptcy Court will either entertain this Court’s fee
determinations as “allowed claims” or the District Court will order payment as part of the
Receivership wind down process.

IT IS SO ORDERED.
7k

SIGNED this /& th day of April, 2013.

&MW
Royal’Furgpéon

Senior United States District Judge

13-10696.27864
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IN THE UNITED STATES DISTRICT COURT
FOR THE NORTHERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS
DALLAS DIVISION

NETSPHERE, INC.,
MANILA INDUSTRIES, INC., AND
MUNISH KRISHAN

PLAINTIFFS,
V. CIVIL ACTION NO. 3:09-CV-0988-F

JEFFREY BARON AND
ONDOVA LIMITED COMPANY,

wn W W W W W LW W W W W W

DEFENDANTS.

THE RECEIVER’S INVENTORY OF ASSETS AS OF APRIL 19, 2013

Pursuant to this Court’s Order of April 8, 2013 [Docket No. 1123], the Receiver files this,
Inventory.
Respectfully submitted,
PETER S. VOGEL, RECEIVER

By:  /s/ Peter S. Vogel
Peter S. Vogel

Texas Bar No. 206010500
1601 Elm Street, Suite 3000
Dallas, Texas 75201

(214) 999-3000

(214) 999-3422 (Fax)

PETER S. VOGEL RECEIVER

CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE

| hereby certify that a true and correct copy of the foregoing document was served via the
Court’s ECF system on all counsel of record on April 19, 2013.

By: /sl Peter S. Vogel
Peter S. Vogel
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Receiver’s Inventory of Assets as of April 19, 2013

(Redacted Account Numbers)

1. Stock Account:

The following stock account was brought under the Receiver’s control, the cash portion
($412,293.20) was transferred to Comerica account xxxxxx5361 listed below in Table 3C** with
a March 31, 2013 balance of $3,036.20, but the stock was never liquidated:

Institution Account Name Account Number | Account Type Amount Believed
to Be in Stock
Account

TD Ameritrade Jeffrey Baron XX#X X581 Stock $378,930.87

2. IRA Account:
A. The following IRA accounts were frozen at the request of the Receiver but never

liquidated:
Institution Account Name | Account Number Account Type Amount
Believed to Be in
Account
The Vanguard Jeffrey D. Baron | XXXX- Non-Roth IRA $40,006.34
Group XXXXXXXX792
Dreyfus The Bank of XXXXXXXXXXX491 Roth Conversion | $4,915.26
Investments New York IRA
Mellon Cust
f/b/o Jeffrey D.
Baron
Sterling Trust Co. | Jeff Baron XX855 Roth IRA $48,570.75
Mid-Ohio Equity Trust Co. | XXX-XXX396 Roth IRA Monies included
Securities Corp. Cust IRA of in Equity Trust
Jeffrey Baron below in Table
2B.
Delaware Charter | Jeff Baron XXXX003 Non-Roth IRA Cash balance of

Guarantee &
Trustd/b/a
Principal Trust
Co. (dealt with
Interactive
Brokers, LLC)

$242,979.70

Stock balance of
$64,800.00

THE RECEIVER’S INVENTORY OF ASSETS AS OF APRIL 19, 2013

Page 2
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B. The following IRA account was identified but never accessed/frozen by the Receiver due
to the institution’s refusal to cooperate:

Institution Account | Account | Account Component Investments Amount
Name Number | Type Believed to Be
in Account
Equity Trust | Jeffrey XX471 Roth IRA $792,279.50 cash $839,818.05
Co. Baron $135,424 brokerage account
$350 Buena Vista investment [ncludes Mid-
$250 Buena Vista investment Ohio Securities
$1 option to purchase real estate  |Corp.
$400 Northeastern Mortgage
$179 20 domain names

3. Bank Accounts:

A. Current Receiver’s Comerica Banking Account

Type Comerica Current Balance March 31, 2013
account

Checking XXXXXX6589 $27,871.21

B. The following are the Quantec and Novo Point bank accounts at BBVA Compass Bank:

Account Name Account Number | Account Type BBVA Current

Balance March 31,
2013
Quantec, LL.C XXXXXXX323 Operating $243,586.83
Novo Point, LLC XXXXXXX315 Operating $289,732.30

C. The following are the Baron bank accounts from which the Receiver moved funds to
Receiver accounts at Comerica:

Institution Account Account Account Amount Current |Comerica
Name Number Type Transferred | Comerica | Current
to Receiver Account Balance
Accounts at March 31,
Comerica at 2013
the
beginning of
the
Receivership
Las Colinas Jeff D. XXXXX290 Money $156,874.52 |XXXXXX4497 $0
Federal Credit | Baron Market
Union
Capitol One Jeffrey D. | XXXXXXX908 | Money $139,080.53 [XXXXXX4471 $0
Bank Baron Market
Capitol One Jeffrey D. | XXXXXXX961 | Savings | $3,921.75 XXXXXX9426 | $4,026.13
Bank Baron

THE RECEIVER’S INVENTORY OF ASSETS AS OF APRIL 19, 2013 Page 3
13-10696.27867



13-10696.27867


Case 3:09-cv-00988-L

Document 1237 Filed 04/19/13 Page 4 of 5 PagelD 63507

Institution Account Account Account Amount Current |Comerica
Name Number Type Transferred | Comerica | Current
to Receiver Account Balance
Accounts at March 31,
Comerica at 2013
the
beginning of
the
Receivership
Capitol One Jeffrey D. | XXXXXXX614 | Checking | $41.84 XXXXXX8455| $141.84
Bank Baron
Woodforest Jeffrey D. | XXXXXXX261 | Checking | $226,771.62 |[XXXXXX6373| $573.49
National Bank | Baron
American Jeffrey D. | XXXXXXX893 | Prime $4,799.94 XXXXXX4943|$3,115.95
Century Baron Money
Investments Market
Comerica Netsphere Checking | $15,715.80 XXXXXX4463|$7,703.72
investigating | check
TD Money XXXXXX5361|$3,036.20
Ameritrade** Market
(Table 1)

D. Comerica Bank Account Opened in January, 2011 with $100, and still open today but no

transactions
Name Comerica# AMOUNT
Manassas XXXXXX5064 $100

E. Comerica Bank Accounts Opened on January 6, 2011 by the Receiver with $100 but no

transactions

Name Comerica# AMOUNT CLOSED
Dreyfus Appreciation Fund XXXXXX4448 $100 July 7, 2011
Dreyfus Basic Government Money XXXXXX4794 $100 July 7,2011
Market
SouthPac Funds XXXXXX5056 $100 July 11,2011

THE RECEIVER’S INVENTORY OF ASSETS AS OF APRIL 19, 2013

Page 4
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4, Accounts Receivable:
Account Debtor Nature of Account Estimated Amounts Due
Netsphere Settlement Payments Estimates $700,000.00 plus
variable monthly payments
Ondova Bankruptcy Trustee | September 15,2010 Order of $330,000.00
Judge Jernigan for Novo Point and
Quantec to fund Ondova’s
attorneys’ fees claims
Ondova Bankruptcy Trustee | Disgorgement of Prior Payment in $379,761.18
May 2012
Domain Holdings Group Monthly Monetizer Payments Varies by month, March 2013
payments were:
Novo Point -$43,362.92
Quantec -$201,747.92
5. Domain Names:

The Novo Point LLC portfolio contains approximately 3,324 domain names.

The Quantec LLC portfolio contains approximately 150,944 domain names.

Gardere01 - 6272360v.2

THE RECEIVER’S INVENTORY OF ASSETS AS OF APRIL 19, 2013 Page 5
13-10696.27869
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IN THE UNITED STATES DISTRICT COURT
FOR THE NORTHERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS
DALLAS DIVISION

NETSPHERE, INC.,
MANILA INDUSTRIES, INC. AND
MUNISH KRISHAN

PLAINTIFFS,
V. CIVIL ACTION NO. 3:09-CV-0988-F
JEFFREY BARON AND

ONDOVA LIMITED COMPANY,
DEFENDANTS

(922 X272 M770X770X070X7707707720772R %72 M 272X %72]

TRUSTEE’S RESPONSE TO THE RECEIVER’S
MOTION TO QUASH [DKT 1226]

Daniel J. Sherman, Chapter 11 Trustee of the Ondova Bankruptcy Estate (the “Trustee”)
files this Response to the Motion to Quash filed by Peter Vogel, Receiver (the “Receiver) as
follows:

In order to demonstrate his commitment to having a constructive and successful
mediation the Trustee withdraws his Notice of Deposition. Therefore the Motion to Quash is

moot.

Respectfully submitted,

/s/ Richard M. Hunt

Raymond J. Urbanik

Texas State Bar No. 20414050
Richard M. Hunt

Texas State Bar No. 10288700
MUNSCH HARDT KOPF & HARR, P.C.
3800 Lincoln Plaza

500 N. Akard Street

Dallas, Texas 75201

(214) 855-7500 (telephone)
(214) 855-7584 (facsimile)
E-mail: rurbanik@munsch.com
E-mail: rhunt@munsch.com

TRUSTEE’S RESPONSE TO MOTION TO QUASH PAGE 1
MHDocs 4364548_1 11236.1
13-10696.27870
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ATTORNEYS FOR DEFENDANT/
APPELLEE CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE
DANIEL J. SHERMAN FOR ONDOVA

CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE

| hereby certify that, on 19th day of April, 2013, a true and correct copy of the foregoing

document was served via the Court's ECF system on all counsel of record.

/s/ Richard M. Hunt
Richard M. Hunt

TRUSTEE’S RESPONSE TO MOTION TO QUASH PAGE 2
MHDocs 4364548_1 11236.1
13-10696.27871
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IN THE UNITED STATES DISTRICT COURT
FOR THE NORTHERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS
DALLAS DIVISION

NETSPHERE, INC.,
MANILA INDUSTRIES, INC,,
AND MUNISH KRISHAN
PLAINTIFFS,
V. CIVIL ACTION NO. 3:09-CV-0988-F

JEFFREY BARON AND
ONDOVA LIMITED COMPANY,

DEFENDANTS.

wn W W N N W LW LN LN N LN LN

MOTION FOR DISCOVERY, FOR CONTINUANCE AND TO RE-CONSIDER
FUNDING FOR JEFFREY BARON’S COUNSEL

Jeffrey Baron, by and through his attorneys, file their Motion for Discovery,

for Continuance and Motion Funding for Trial, and in support states:

l. Statement of Facts

1. The court issued a scheduling order on April 5, 2013 [1220] for a trial

on the issue of various fee applications filed by the Receiver.

2. On April 4, 2013, the court denied Baron’s request for attorney fees

and for fees for experts to contest the matter.

3. The Receiver, Trustee and their lawyers has just yesterday afternoon
provided their fee applications, which the undersigned counsel has not yet

reviewed, but understands that there are thousands, if not tens of thousands

13-10696.27872
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of billing entries upon which the Receiver, Trustee and their lawyers rely in
of their claims for millions in fees. Baron’s counsel has not been permitted
discovery and has not been provided funds to conduct such discovery, as all
of Baron’s funds are in the receivership estate. It would take the undersigned
counsel and co-counsel several weeks of non-stop document review to
understand and determine the reasonableness and/or the necessity of the

billing.

4, The court’s deadline for Mr. Baron’s objections to the billing motions
are eight days from the date the motions were made, twelve days to hearing
on the objections and a trial within and barely 20 days from the time of

disclosure to trial.

5. In the meantime, counsel have been preparing substantive mediation
position papers for submission to Judge Clark for mediation ordered by the
Bankruptcy Court, and will be engaged in mediation from April 22-23,
2013. Thus, the real time allowed for preparation for the trial on fees is

barely 15 days prior to trial.

6. It is appears that many of the Receiver, Trustee and their lawyers’

billings in this case are inflated, duplicative or unnecessary. However,

13-10696.27873
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counsel needs adequate time and resources to analyze the billings, to retain

experts and staff to assist in this monumental task.

7. With Mr. Baron prohibited, by virtue of the receivership order, from
using his own funds to hire counsel, the undersigned counsel has been
working unpaid in this case since September 28, 2013 and Ed Wright has not

been paid at all.

8. Counsel also need the assistance of their client on this project.
However, the Bankrutpcy Court ordered production of documents and
parallel deadlines, for Mr. Baron’s involuntary bankruptcy trial, during the
same period that counsel are preparing for trial on the fees in this Court,

diverting Mr. Baron from preparation on the fee trial in this Court..

9. Baron respectfully moves the District Court to reconsider his request
to have access to his funds to hire attorneys along with support staff to
represent him in objecting to the fee applications. Unlike large law firms,
who have staff on hand to assist counsel, both Mr. Cochell and Mr. Wright
are solo practitioners who have limited resources, which make it difficult to
set aside work for other clients and devote numerous hours of time to

reviewing invoices mounting a defense for Mr. Baron.

13-10696.27874
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10. Baron also requests discovery from the claimants to review all
invoices and billing records and to depose fact witnesses. Baron hereby
requests the Court to grant Mr. Baron authorization to make such requests to

the Receiver, Trustee and their counsel and to compel the same to comply.
11. A copy of the requested discovery is attached as Exhibits A and B.

I1.  Discovery and Continuance is a Matter of Due Process.

The Fifth Circuit vacated the receivership and held that receivership orders
do “not allow for a determination of the substantive rights of involved parties” and
may not be used “as a vehicle to adjudicate the substantive rights of non-judgment
third parties.” The Fifth Circuit held that this rule ultimately springs from due
process concerns. (such a remedy “completely bypasses our system of affording

due process”).

In its remand, the Court held that “charging the current receivership fund for
reasonable receivership expenses, without allowing any additional assets to be

sold, is an equitable solution.” 5" Cir. Opinion at 27.

In light of our ruling that the receivership was improper, equity may
well require the fees to be discounted meaningfully from what would have
been reasonable under a proper receivership. Fees already paid were
calculated on the basis that the receivership was proper. Therefore, the
amount of all fees and expense must be reconsidered by the district court.
Any other payments made from the receivership fund may also be
reconsidered as appropriate. (emphasis supplied).

4
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5™ Cir. Opinion at 27.

Counsel for Mr. Baron are relatively new to the overall litigation and have a
challenge duplicating the knowledge of the Trustee and Receiver, who retained
large, well funded law firms and were actively involved in the case. On the flip
side, Baron has two solo practitioners who are not in a position to focus all their
time, money and limited resources on detailed fee applications over the next three
week period without some assistance, and an advance or assurance of payment to

secure help in the effort. Unlike the Receiver, the Trustee and their lawyers, Mr.

Baron either directly owns, or has a beneficial interest in the property at issue, and

should be allowed access to his own resources to properly contest the fees incurred

by the Trustee and the Receiver.

Mismatched parties simply create the appearance, but not the reality of due
process. The Supreme Court has held that a party must be afforded a fair
opportunity to secure counsel “of his own choice.” This right applies “in any case,
civil or criminal” as a due process right “in the constitutional sense”. Powell v.
Alabama, 287 U.S. 45, 53-69 (1932). As a fundamental cornerstone of due process,
the Constitution guarantees every citizen the right to a meaningful opportunity to
be heard in a meaningful manner. Williams v. McKeithen, 939 F.2d 1100, 1105
(5th Cir. 1991). As a matter of established law, this means the right to be

represented by paid counsel. E.g., Mosley, 634 F. 2d at 946; Powell, 287 U.S. at

5
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53; Chandler v. Fretag, 348 U.S. 3, 10 (1954); Potashnick v. Port City Const. Co.,
609 F.2d 1101, 1104 (5™ Cir. 1980). In the instant proceedings, Jeffrey Baron has
paid millions to the Receiver and Trustee but has not been allowed the resources to

match the deadlines and issues before the Court.

WHEREFORE, Jeffrey Baron respectfully requests that this Honorable

Court grant his Motion in its entirety.

Very respectfully,

/s/ Stephen R. Cochell
Stephen R. Cochell
The Cochell Law Firm, P.C.
Texas Bar No. 24044255
7026 Old Katy Rd., Ste 259
Houston, Texas 77096
(713)980-8796 (phone)
(713)980-1179 (facsimile)
srcochell@cochellfirm.com
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CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE

This is to certify that, on April 19, 2013, a copy of this Response was served
on all counsel through the Court’s ECF system.

/sl Stephen R. Cochell
Stephen R. Cochell

CERTIFICATE OF CONFERENCE

Defendant Jeffrey Baron presumes that the Chapter 11 Trustee does not
oppose this Motion as he set the deposition of the Receiver, Peter Vogel, and based
on the opposition of the Noticed deposition by Receiver, Baron presumes counsel
for Receiver will oppose this Motion. Therefore, the Motion is submitted to the

Court for consideration.

/sl Stephen R.Cochell
Stephen R.Cochell
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IN THE UNITED STATES DISTRICT COURT
FOR THE NORTHERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS
DALLAS DIVISION

NETSPHERE, INC.,
MANILA INDUSTRIES, INC,,
AND MUNISH KRISHAN

PLAINTIFFS,
V. CIVIL ACTION NO. 3:09-CV-0988-F

JEFFREY BARON AND
ONDOVA LIMITED COMPANY,

wn W W L N N LW LN LN N LY LN

DEFENDANTS.

JEFF BARON’S SECOND REQUEST
FOR PRODUCTION TO DANIEL J. SHERMAN, TRUSTEE

To: Daniel J. Sherman, Receiver, through his attorney of record, Raymond J Urbanik, Esq.,
Munsch Hardt Kopf & Harr, P.C., 3800 Lincoln Plaza, 500 North Akard Street, Dallas, Texas
75201-6659

Jeffrey Baron serves this request for production on Peter Vogel, Receiver, as authorized
by Federal Rule of Civil Procedure 34. Daniel J. Sherman, Trustee (the “Trustee”) must
produce all requested documents, electronically stored information, or tangible things within
his possession, custody or control within the time deadline specified by the Court, or as agreed
to between the parties, at the offices of Stephen R. Cochell, 7026 Old Katy Rd., Ste 259,
Houston Texas 77024 or at another time and place agreed on by the parties.

Definitions
The following terms have the following meanings, unless the context requires otherwise:

1. Parties. The term “plaintiff” or “defendant,” as well as a party’s full or abbreviated
name or a pronoun referring to a party, means the party and, when applicable, his agents,
representatives, officers, directors, employees, partners, corporate parent, subsidiaries, or
affiliates. This definition is not intended to impose a discovery obligation on any person who
is not a party to the litigation.

2. Person. The term “person” means any natural person, a business, a legal or
governmental entity, or an association.

3. You & your. The terms “you” and “your” mean the Trustee, Daniel Sherman and his

1
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agents, representatives,_attorneys, including Munsch Hardt Kopf & Harr, experts, and other
persons acting or purporting to act on the Trustee’s behalf.

4. Material. The term “material” means all documents, electronically stored information,
or tangible things. The term is synonymous with and equal in scope to the terms
“documents,” “electronically stored information,” and “tangible things” in Federal Rule of
Civil Procedure 34(a)(1). A draft or nonidentical copy of a document, electronically stored
information, or a tangible thing is a separate item within the meaning of this term.

a. Document. The term “document” means information that is fixed in a tangible
medium, such as paper. It includes, but is not limited to, writings, drawings,
films, charts, photographs, notices, memoranda, diaries, minutes,
correspondence, books, journals, ledgers, reports, worksheets, notes, printed e-
mails, letters, abstracts, audits, charts, checks, diagrams, drafts, instructions,
lists, logs, resumes, and summaries.

b. Electronically stored information. The term “electronically stored information”
means electronic information that is stored in a medium from which it can be
retrieved and examined. It includes, but is not limited to, all electronic files that
are electronically stored.

(1)  “Electronic file” includes, but is not limited to, the following: voicemail
messages and files; e-mail messages and files; deleted files; temporary
files; system-history files; Internet- or web-browser-generated
information stored in textual, graphical, or audio format, including
history files, caches, and cookies; computer-activity logs; and/or
metadata.. Unless otherwise defined, each example used to illustrate the
term “electronic file” will have the meaning assigned to it by {identify
source for definitions, e.g., Sedona Conference Glossary: E-Discovery
& Digital Information Management (Second Edition) (2007), Webster’s
New World Computer Dictionary (10th ed. 2003), or Microsoft
Computer Dictionary (5th ed. 2002)}.

(2)  “Electronic information system” refers to a computer system or network
that contains electronic files and electronic storage. Unless otherwise
defined, each example used to illustrate the term “electronic information
system” will have the meaning assigned to it by the Sedona Conference
Glossary: E-Discovery & Digital Information Management (Second
Edition) (2007), Webster’s New World Computer Dictionary (10th ed.
2003),or Microsoft Computer Dictionary (5th ed. 2002)}.

(3)  “Electronic storage” refers to electronic files contained on magnetic,
optical, or other storage media, such as hard drives, flash drives, DVDs,
CDs, tapes, cartridges, floppy diskettes, smart cards, and/or integrated-
circuit cards (e.g., SIM cards). Unless otherwise defined, each example
used to illustrate the term “electronic storage” will have the meaning
assigned to it by the Sedona Conference Glossary: E-Discovery &

2
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Digital Information Management (Second Edition) (2007), Webster’s
New World Computer Dictionary (10th ed. 2003), Microsoft Computer
Dictionary (5th ed. 2002)}.

C. Tangible thing. The term “tangible thing” means a physical object that is not a
document or electronically stored information.

5. Communication. The term “communication” means the transmittal of information in
the form of facts, ideas, inquiries, or otherwise.

6. Relating. The term “relating” means concerning, referring, describing, evidencing, or
constituting, either directly or indirectly.

7. Any. The term *“any” should be understood in either its most or its least inclusive sense
as necessary to bring within the scope of the discovery request all responses that might
otherwise be construed to be outside its scope.

8. And & or. The connectives “and” and “or” should be construed either conjunctively or
disjunctively as necessary to bring within the scope of the discovery request all responses
that might otherwise be construed to be outside its scope.

9. Number. The use of the singular form of any word includes the plural and vice versa.

10. Relevant Time Period. The relevant time period for all document requests herein
spans from the date the Court authorized appointment of the receivership through the date of
production of documents requested herein.

11. “Appraisal Reports”: Means all reports, data compilations, print-outs, charts, lists,
and the like, that contain, or purport to contain appraisals, valuations, price estimate, or any
other designation of value, estimated value, income, or income potential for any domain
name or right in or to a domain name owned by Quantec LLC or NovoPoint LLC.

12. “Bankruptcy Case”: refers to Case No. 09-34784-SGJ pending in the Bankruptcy
Court, Northern District of Texas, Dallas Division and any other related cases or matters
relating to, or ancillary to that action.

13. “District Court Case” or “Receivership Case”: refers to Case Number 3:09cv00988
pending the District Court, Northern District of Texas, Dallas Division and any other related
cases or matters relating to, or ancillary to that action.

14.  “Receivership”: refers to the receivership created in, or arising out of the District
Court Case.

15.  “Domain Names” or “domain names”: refers to the 150,000 domain names that are
the subject of the proposed auction.
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Instructions

1. Respond to each request for production separately by listing the materials and by
describing them as defined above. If the material is numbered or labeled for production, in
each response provide both the information that identifies the material and the material’s
number or label.

2. Produce documents and tangible things in the forms as they are kept in the ordinary
course of business, or organize and number or label them to correspond with the categories in
the discovery request.

3. Produce electronically stored information in electronic format. Specifically, we request
that you produce documents in native format and in TIFF format maintaining all associated
metadata. For any electronically stored information produced:

a. Produce a discovery log that details the type of information, the source of the
information, the discovery request to which the information corresponds, and
the information’s electronic ID number.

b. Write all of the electronically stored information to a cd, dvd, flash drive or
external hard drive.

4. For electronically stored information, identify every source containing potentially
responsive information that the Trustee is not searching or producing.

5. If objecting to a request for production, state the objection with particularity, providing
specific grounds for the objection.

6. For any materials that the Trustee asserts are privileged, protected, or otherwise exempt
from discovery, provide the following:

a. The specific grounds for the claim of privilege, protection, or other exemption.

b. The type of material being withheld, and, if the material is electronically stored
information, the file format of the material.

C. The subject matter of the material.

d. The date of the material.

e. The name, job title, and address of the author of the material.

f. The name, job title, and address of each addressee of the material.

g. The name, job title, and address of each person who received, was copied on, or
otherwise saw all, part, or a summary of the material.

h.  The name, job title, and address of the custodian of the material and the
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material’s current location.

7. For any materials that you claim no longer exist or cannot be located, provide all of the
following:

a. A statement identifying the material.

b. A statement of how and when the material ceased to exist or when it could no
longer be located.

C. The reasons for the material’s nonexistence or loss.

d. The identity, address, and job title of each person having knowledge about the
nonexistence or loss of the material.

e. The identity of any other materials evidencing the nonexistence or loss of the
material or any facts about the nonexistence or loss.

REQUESTS FOR PRODUCTION

REQUEST 1: Any and all documents relating to the solicitation of Baron’s
lawyers or lawyers who are claimants in the receivership.

RESPONGSE:

REQUEST 2: Documents relating to contacts with potential claimants
who made claims asserting that Jeffrey Baron owed them money for legal
services.

RESPONSE:

REQUEST 3: Documents relating to contacts with potential claimants
who did not make claims against Jeffrey Baron asserting that he owed
them money for legal services.

RESPONSE:
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REQUEST 4: Document pertaining to sales, or proposed sales of domain
names prior to the auction conducted in the Ondova case.

RESPONSE:

REQUEST 5: All affidavits signed by Damon Nelson regarding sale,
marketing, or negotiations for the sale of domain names.

RESPONGSE:

REQUEST 6: Correspondence Relating to Joseph Dauben and issues
including, but not limited to, statements by Mr. Dauben regarding Mr.
Vogel and prior judgments obtained or being enforced by Gardere against
Dauben.

RESPONSE:

REQUEST 7: Communications between Receiver and Trustee’s counsel
(and/or counsel) regarding the receivership

RESPONSE:
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REQUEST 8: Documents between the Trustee, Receiver and/or Elizabeth
Shurig regarding tax liability and related issues for any receivership
party.

RESPONGSE:

REQUEST 9: Documents relating to communications between any of the
attorney claimants and Peter Vogel, Daniel Sherman, and/or the
Receiver’s lawyers.

RESPONGSE:

REQUEST 10:

Documents relating to communications between the Receiver and the
Trustee or protector of the Village Trust.

RESPONSE:

REQUEST 11: Documents concerning meetings and calendars of
meetings between Receiver & Trustee.

RESPONGSE:
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REQUEST 12: Documents related to communications between Trustee or
Trustee’s counsel and Receiver or Receiver’s counsel.

RESPONSE:

REQUEST 13: Documents concerning communications between Jeff
Baron and Peter Vogel from 2001 through 2004.

RESPONSE:

REQUEST 14: Documents concerning communications between Jeff
Baron and Dawn Estes at Gardere from 2001 through 2004.

RESPONSE:

REQUEST 15: Documents reflecting the cash and asset balances of the
Ondova Estate from the beginning of the bankruptcy to the present (by
month/quarter/year).

RESPONSE:
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Very respectfully,
/s/Stephen R. Cochell

Stephen R. Cochell

The Cochell Law Firm, P.C.

Texas Bar No. 24044255
7026 Old Katy Rd., Ste 259
Houston, Texas 77096
(713)980-8796 (phone)
(713)980-1179 (facsimile)
srcochell@cochellfirm.com

CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE

I hereby certify that this document was served electronically to counsel for the Receiver,
David Schenk and Jeff Fine, and counsel for the Trustee, Ray Urbanik and Richard Hunt, and

John MacPete by email on April 19, 2013.

Ray Urbanik

Richard M. Hunt
MUNSCH HARDT

500 N. Akard Street
Dallas, Texas 75201-6659
214.978.5352
rhunt@munsch.com
rurbanik@munsch.com

David S. Schenck

Jeff Fine

Dykema Gosset

1717 Main Street, Ste 4000
Dallas Texas 75201
(214)462-6401 F
dschenck@dykema.com
jfine@dykema.com

John W. McPete
Macpete IP Law

P.O. Box 224726
Dallas Texas 75222
(214)564-5205
jmacpete@jmacpeteipla

/S/ Stephen R. Cochell
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IN THE UNITED STATES DISTRICT COURT
FOR THE NORTHERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS
DALLAS DIVISION

NETSPHERE, INC.,
MANILA INDUSTRIES, INC,,
AND MUNISH KRISHAN

PLAINTIFFS,
V. CIVIL ACTION NO. 3:09-CV-0988-F

JEFFREY BARON AND
ONDOVA LIMITED COMPANY,

wn W W L N N LW LN LN N LY LN

DEFENDANTS.

JEFF BARON’S FIRST REQUEST
FOR PRODUCTION TO PETER VOGEL, RECEIVER

To: Peter Vogel, Receiver, through his attorney of record, David Schenck, Dykema Gossett,
1717 Main Street, Ste 4000, Dallas Texas 75201

Jeffrey Baron serves this request for production on Peter VVogel, Receiver, as authorized by
Federal Rule of Civil Procedure 34. As agreed between the parties, Peter Vogel, Receiver (the
“Receiver”) must produce all requested documents, electronically stored information, or
tangible things within the time deadline specified by the Court, or as agreed to between the
parties, at the offices of Stephen R. Cochell, 7026 Old Katy Rd., Ste 259, Houston Texas
77024 or at another time and place agreed on by the parties.

Definitions
The following terms have the following meanings, unless the context requires otherwise:

1. Parties. The term “plaintiff” or “defendant,” as well as a party’s full or abbreviated
name or a pronoun referring to a party, means the party and, when applicable, his agents,
representatives, officers, directors, employees, partners, corporate parent, subsidiaries, or
affiliates. This definition is not intended to impose a discovery obligation on any person who
is not a party to the litigation.

2. Person. The term “person” means any natural person, a business, a legal or
governmental entity, or an association.

3. You & Your. The terms “you” and “your” mean the Receiver, Peter Vogel and his
1
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agents, representatives, attorneys, including Dykema Gossett, experts, and other persons
acting or purporting to act on the Receiver’s behalf.

4. Material. The term “material” means all documents, electronically stored information,
or tangible things. The term is synonymous with and equal in scope to the terms
“documents,” “electronically stored information,” and “tangible things” in Federal Rule of
Civil Procedure 34(a)(1). A draft or nonidentical copy of a document, electronically stored
information, or a tangible thing is a separate item within the meaning of this term.

a. Document. The term “document” means information that is fixed in a tangible
medium, such as paper. It includes, but is not limited to, writings, drawings,
films, charts, photographs, notices, memoranda, diaries, minutes,
correspondence, books, journals, ledgers, reports, worksheets, notes, printed e-
mails, letters, abstracts, audits, charts, checks, diagrams, drafts, instructions,
lists, logs, resumes, and summaries.

b. Electronically stored information. The term “electronically stored information”
means electronic information that is stored in a medium from which it can be
retrieved and examined. It includes, but is not limited to, all electronic files that
are electronically stored.

(1)  “Electronic file” includes, but is not limited to, the following: voicemail
messages and files; e-mail messages and files; deleted files; temporary
files; system-history files; Internet- or web-browser-generated
information stored in textual, graphical, or audio format, including
history files, caches, and cookies; computer-activity logs; and/or
metadata.. Unless otherwise defined, each example used to illustrate the
term “electronic file” will have the meaning assigned to it by {identify
source for definitions, e.g., Sedona Conference Glossary: E-Discovery
& Digital Information Management (Second Edition) (2007), Webster’s
New World Computer Dictionary (10th ed. 2003), or Microsoft
Computer Dictionary (5th ed. 2002)}.

(2)  “Electronic information system” refers to a computer system or network
that contains electronic files and electronic storage. Unless otherwise
defined, each example used to illustrate the term “electronic information
system” will have the meaning assigned to it by the Sedona Conference
Glossary: E-Discovery & Digital Information Management (Second
Edition) (2007), Webster’s New World Computer Dictionary (10th ed.
2003),or Microsoft Computer Dictionary (5th ed. 2002)}.

(3)  “Electronic storage” refers to electronic files contained on magnetic,
optical, or other storage media, such as hard drives, flash drives, DVDs,
CDs, tapes, cartridges, floppy diskettes, smart cards, and/or integrated-
circuit cards (e.g., SIM cards). Unless otherwise defined, each example
used to illustrate the term “electronic storage” will have the meaning
assigned to it by the Sedona Conference Glossary: E-Discovery &
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Digital Information Management (Second Edition) (2007), Webster’s
New World Computer Dictionary (10th ed. 2003), Microsoft Computer
Dictionary (5th ed. 2002)}.

C. Tangible thing. The term “tangible thing” means a physical object that is not a
document or electronically stored information.

5. Communication. The term “communication” means the transmittal of information in
the form of facts, ideas, inquiries, or otherwise.

6. Relating. The term “relating” means concerning, referring, describing, evidencing, or
constituting, either directly or indirectly.

7. Any. The term *“any” should be understood in either its most or its least inclusive sense
as necessary to bring within the scope of the discovery request all responses that might
otherwise be construed to be outside its scope.

8. And & or. The connectives “and” and “or” should be construed either conjunctively or
disjunctively as necessary to bring within the scope of the discovery request all responses
that might otherwise be construed to be outside its scope.

9. Number. The use of the singular form of any word includes the plural and vice versa.

10. Relevant Time Period. The relevant time period for all document requests herein
spans from the date the Court authorized appointment of the receivership through the date of
production of documents requested herein.

11. “Appraisal Reports”: Means all reports, data compilations, print-outs, charts, lists,
and the like, that contain, or purport to contain appraisals, valuations, price estimate, or any
other designation of value, estimated value, income, or income potential for any domain
name or right in or to a domain name owned by Quantec LLC or NovoPoint LLC.

12. “Bankruptcy Case”: refers to Case No. 09-34784-SGJ pending in the Bankruptcy
Court, Northern District of Texas, Dallas Division and any other related cases or matters
relating to, or ancillary to that action.

13. “District Court Case” or “Receivership Case”: refers to Case Number 3:09cv00988
pending the District Court, Northern District of Texas, Dallas Division and any other related
cases or matters relating to, or ancillary to that action.

14.  “Receivership”: refers to the receivership created in, or arising out of the District
Court Case.

15.  “Domain Names” or “domain names”: refers to the 150,000 domain names that are
the subject of the proposed auction.
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Instructions

1. Respond to each request for production separately by listing the materials and by
describing them as defined above. If the material is numbered or labeled for production, in
each response provide both the information that identifies the material and the material’s
number or label.

2. Produce documents and tangible things in the forms as they are kept in the ordinary
course of business, or organize and number or label them to correspond with the categories in
the discovery request.

3. Produce electronically stored information in electronic format. Specifically, we request
that you produce documents in native format and in TIFF format maintaining all associated
metadata. For any electronically stored information produced:

a. Produce a discovery log that details the type of information, the source of the
information, the discovery request to which the information corresponds, and
the information’s electronic ID number.

b. Write all of the electronically stored information to a cd, dvd, flash drive or
external hard drive.

4. For electronically stored information, identify every source containing potentially
responsive information that the Receiver is not searching or producing.

5. If objecting to a request for production, state the objection with particularity, providing
specific grounds for the objection.

6. For any materials that the Receiver asserts are privileged, protected, or otherwise
exempt from discovery, provide the following:

a. The specific grounds for the claim of privilege, protection, or other exemption.

b. The type of material being withheld, and, if the material is electronically stored
information, the file format of the material.

C. The subject matter of the material.

d. The date of the material.

e. The name, job title, and address of the author of the material.

f. The name, job title, and address of each addressee of the material.

g. The name, job title, and address of each person who received, was copied on, or
otherwise saw all, part, or a summary of the material.

h.  The name, job title, and address of the custodian of the material and the
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material’s current location.

7. For any materials that you claim no longer exist or cannot be located, provide all of the
following:

a. A statement identifying the material.

b. A statement of how and when the material ceased to exist or when it could no
longer be located.

C. The reasons for the material’s nonexistence or loss.

d. The identity, address, and job title of each person having knowledge about the
nonexistence or loss of the material.

e. The identity of any other materials evidencing the nonexistence or loss of the
material or any facts about the nonexistence or loss.

REQUESTS FOR PRODUCTION

REQUEST 1: Any and all documents relating to any review by Dykema
of a potential conflict of interest in undertaking representation of the
Receiver, including potential conflict of interest in being adverse to Jeffrey
Baron.

RESPONSE:

REQUEST 2: Documents relating to contacts with potential claimants
who made claims asserting that Jeffrey Baron owed them money for legal
services.

RESPONGSE:
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REQUEST 3: Document pertaining to sales, or proposed sales, of
domain names prior to the auction conducted in the Ondova case.

RESPONSE:

REQUEST 4: All affidavits signed by Damon Nelson regarding sale,
marketing, or negotiations for the sale of domain names.

RESPONSE:

REQUEST 5: All correspondence relating to UDRP claims filed against
Novo Point, LLC, or Quantec, LLC

RESPONSE:

REQUEST 6: Copies of form letters used by the Receiver or their
agents, including Joshua Cox and James Eckels responding to UDRP
claims.

RESPONGSE:

REQUEST 7: Documents relating to tax services provided by Grant
Thornton undertaken for the receivership concerning Novo Point, Quantec,
and/or Jeffrey Baron.

RESPONSE:
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REQUEST 8: Correspondence Relating to Joseph (a.k.a. “Joey”)
Dauben and issues including but not limited to statements by Mr. Dauben
regarding Mr. Vogel and prior judgments being enforced by Gardere
against Dauben.

RESPONSE:

REQUEST 9: Documents relating to the Hellerman Barret public
relations firm and investigation of Mr. Baron and that firm for alleged
violations of the receivership order.

RESPONSE:

REQUEST 10: Communications between Receiver and Trustee’s counsel
(and/or counsel) regarding the Receivership .

RESPONSE:

REQUEST 11: Documents relating to communication between the
Receiver, his lawyers, and Jeff Harbin.

RESPONSE:

REQUEST 12: Documents between the Trustee, Receiver and/or
Elizabeth Shurig regarding tax liability and related issues for Novo Point,
LLC, Quantec, LLC, and Jeff Baron.
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RESPONSE:

REQUEST 13: Documents relating to communications between any of
the attorney claimants and Peter Vogel, Daniel Sherman, and/or the
Receiver’s lawyers.

RESPONSE:

REQUEST 14: Documents concerning selling or monetizing domain
names.

RESPONSE:

REQUEST 15: Documents relating to communications between the
Receiver and the Village Trust or the Trustee.

RESPONGSE:

REQUEST 16: Documents relating to communications between the
Receiver and the registrar Fabulous.

RESPONSE:

REQUEST 17: Documents relating to communications between the
Receiver and Domain Holdings, including but not limited to dashboard
reports.
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RESPONSE:

REQUEST 18: Documents relating to communications between the
Receiver and sedo.com .

RESPONSE:

REQUEST 19: Documents relating to communications between the
Receiver and the UDRP dispute resolution service providers: WIPO or
National Arbitration Forum.

RESPONGSE:

REQUEST 20: Documents relating to communications between the
Receiver and ICANN.

RESPONSE:

REQUEST 21: Produce calendars reflecting telephone or in-person
meetings between the Receiver & Trustee and any agendas for said
meetings.

RESPONSE:
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REQUEST 22: Documents regarding substitution of counsel, including
memoranda, correspondence, or emails regarding the same.

RESPONSE:

Very respectfully,

/s/Stephen R. Cochell
Stephen R. Cochell
The Cochell Law Firm, P.C.
Texas Bar No. 24044255
7026 Old Katy Rd., Ste 259
Houston, Texas 77096
(713)980-8796 (phone)
(713)980-1179 (facsimile)
srcochell@cochellfirm.com

CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE

I hereby certify that this document was served electronically to counsel for the Receiver, David
Schenk and Jeff Fine, and counsel for the Trustee, Ray Urbanik and Richard Hunt, and John
MacPete by email on April 19, 2013.

Ray Urbanik

Richard M. Hunt

MUNSCH HARDT

KOPF & HARR, P.C. DALLAS | HOUSTON | AUSTIN
500 N. Akard Street

Dallas, Texas 75201-6659

214.978.5352
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rhunt@munsch.com
rurbanik@munsch.com

David S. Schenck

Jeff Fine

Dykema Gosset

1717 Main Street, Ste 4000
Dallas Texas 75201
(214)462-6401 F
dschenck@dykema.com
jfine@dykema.com

John W. McPete

Macpete IP Law

P.O. Box 224726

Dallas Texas 75222
(214)564-5205
jmacpete@jmacpeteiplaw
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IN THE UNITED STATES DISTRICT COURT
FOR THE NORTHERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS
DALLAS DIVISION

NETSPHERE, INC.,
MANILA INDUSTRIES, INC., and
MUNISH KRISHAN,

Plaintiffs.

Civil Action No. 3-09CV0988-F

V.

JEFFREY BARON, and
ONDOVA LIMITED COMPANY,
Defendants.

wn W W W W W W L N LW W L LN

ORDER GRANTING BARON MOTION FOR CONTINUANCE AND DISCOVERY

The Court, having reviewed Baron’s Motion for Continuance and Discovery
in the above-entitled and numbered cause, and being otherwise fully advised in the

premises;

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that the Motion is GRANTED in all respects

and the trial on fee applications is hereby continued.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that Baron be allowed access to his funds to
hire attorneys along with support staff to represent him in objecting to the fee

applications.
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IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that Baron be allowed to obtain discovery
from the claimants to review all invoices and billing records as well as depose fact

witnesses.

SIGNED on this day of April, 2013.

U.S. DISTRICT JUDGE
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Gerrit M. Pronske

State Bar No. 16351640

Melanie P. Goolsby

State Bar No. 24059841

PRONSKE & PATEL, P.C.

2200 Ross Avenue, Suite 5350
Dallas, Texas 75201

(214) 658-6500 - Telephone

(214) 658-6509 — Telecopier

Email: gpronske@pronskepatel.com
Email: mgoolsby@pronskepatel.com

COUNSEL FOR THE PETITIONING CREDITORS

IN THE UNITED DISTRICT COURT
FOR THE NORTHERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS
DALLAS DIVISION

NETSPHERE, INC., MANILA
INDUSTRIES, INC., AND MUNISH
KRISHAN,

Plaintiffs CIVIL ACTION NO. 3:09-cv-0988-F
V.

JEFFREY BARON AND ONDOVA
LIMITED COMPANY,

wn W W W W W W N N LN LN LN

Defendants.

IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
FOR THE NORTHERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS
DALLAS DIVISION

In re: 8
8§ CASE NO. 12-37921-7
JEFFREY BARON, 8
8 INVOLUNTARY CHAPTER 7
Debtor. 8 PROCEEDING

DECLARATION DESIGNATING SETTLEMENT AUTHORITY

I hereby state as follows under penalty of perjury pursuant to 28 U.S.C. § 1746:
1 My name is Gary G. Lyon. | am over the age of eighteen (18) years and am

competent to testify to the matters set forth herein.

DECLARATION DESIGNATING SETTLEMENT AUTHORITY -- Page 1 of 2
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2 This Declaration is provided pursuant to the Order Directing Mediation
entered in the above-captioned cases.

3 I am a petitioning creditor in the above-captioned involuntary case
(together, the “Petitioning Creditors”).

4 I hereby designate Gerrit Pronske, counsel for the Petitioning Creditors who
will be personally attending the court-ordered mediation in the above-captioned cases, as
my personal representative with full and complete authority to enter into a settlement on
my behalf without the necessity of consulting with me during the mediation.

5 To the best of my knowledge, the information contained herein is true and
accurate.

FURTHER DECLARANT SAYETH NOT.

I declare on April 21, 2013 under penalty of perjury that the foregoing is true and
correct.

Isl

DECLARATION DESIGNATING SETTLEMENT AUTHORITY -- Page 2 of 2
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Gerrit M. Pronske

State Bar No. 16351640

Melanie P. Goolsby

State Bar No. 24059841

PRONSKE & PATEL, P.C.

2200 Ross Avenue, Suite 5350
Dallas, Texas 75201

(214) 658-6500 - Telephone

(214) 658-6509 — Telecopier

Email: gpronske @pronskepatel.com
Email: mgoolsby @pronskepatel.com

COUNSEL FOR THE PETITIONING CREDITORS

IN THE UNITED DISTRICT COURT
FOR THE NORTHERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS
DALLAS DIVISION

NETSPHERE, INC., MANILA
INDUSTRIES, INC., AND MUNISH
KRISHAN,

Plaintiffs CIVIL ACTION NO. 3:09-cv-0988-F

V.

JEFFREY BARON AND ONDOVA
LIMITED COMPANY,

L LA LR LD SR SR SR MR L LR LR A

Defendants.

IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
FOR THE NORTHERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS

DALLAS DIVISION
Inre: §
§ CASE NO. 12-37921-7
JEFFREY BARON, §
§ INVOLUNTARY CHAPTER 7
Debtor. § PROCEEDING

DECLARATION DESIGNATING SETTLEMENT AUTHORITY

1 hereby state as follows under penalty of perjury pursuant to 28 U.S.C. § 1746:
1 My name isﬁoé‘\/f J éu’(ff am over the age of eighteen (18) years and am

competent to testify to the matters set forth herein.

DECLARATION DESIGNATING SETTLEMENT AUTHORITY -- Page 1 of 2
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2 This Declaration is provided pursuant to the Order Directing Mediation
entered in the above-captioned cases.

3 I am a petitioning creditor in the above-captioned involuntary case
(together, the “Petitioning Creditors”).

4 I hereby designate Gerrit Pronske, counsel for the Petitioning Creditors who
will be personally attending the court-ordered mediation in the above-captioned cases, as
my personal representative with full and complete authority to enter into a settlement on
my behalf without the necessity of consulting with me during the mediation.

5 To the best of my knowledge, the information contained herein is true and
accurate.

FURTHER DECLARANT SAYETH NOT.

I declare on April 22, 2013under penalty of perjury that the foregoing is true and

correct.

DECLARATION DESIGNATING SETTLEMENT AUTHORITY -- Page 2 of 2
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Gerrit M. Pronske

State Bar No. 16351640

Melanie P. Goolsby

State Bar No. 24059341

PRONSKE & PATEL, P.C.

2200 Ross Avenue, Suite 5350
Dallas, Texas 75201

(214) 658-6500 - Telephone

(214) 658-6509 — Telecopier

Email: gpronske@pronskepatel.com
Email: mgoolsby@pronskepatel.com

COUNSEL FOR THE PETITIONING CREDITORS

IN THE UNITED DISTRICT COURT
FOR THE NORTHERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS

DALLAS DIVISION
NETSPHERE, INC., MANILA §
INDUSTRIES, INC., AND MUNISH §
KRISHAN, §
§
Plaintiffs § CIVIL ACTION NO. 3:09-cv-0988-F

§

v, §
§

JEFFREY BARON AND ONDOVA §
LIMITED COMPANY, §
§

Defendants. §

IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
FOR THE NORTHERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS
DALLAS DIVISION

In re: §
§ CASE NO. 12-37921-7

JEFFREY BARON, §
§ INVOLUNTARY CHAPTER 7

Debtor. § PROCEEDING

DECLARATION DESIGNATING SETTLEMENT AUTHORITY

I hereby state as follows under penalty of perjury pursuant to 28 U.S.C. § 1746:

1 My name is I.ﬁE.y-._;T Hal] am over the age of eighteen (18) years and am

competent to testify to the matters set forth herein.

DECLARATION DESIGNATING SETTLEMENT AUTHORITY -- Page 1 of 2 13-10696.27907
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2 This Declaration is provided pursuant to the Order Directing Mediation
entered in the above-captioned cases.

3 I am a petitioning creditor in the above-captioned involuntary case
(together, the “Petitioning Creditors™).

4 I hereby designate Gerrit Pronske, counsel for the Petitioning Creditors who
will be personally attending the court-ordered mediation in the above-captioned cases, as
my personal representative with full and complete authority to enter into a settlement on
my behalf without the necessity of consulting with me during the mediation.

5 To the best of my knowledge, the information contained herein is true and
accurate.

FURTHER DECLARANT SAYETH NOT.

I declare on April 22, 2013under penalty of perjury that the foregoing is true and

correct.

i —

® Aol
YA
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Gerrit M. Pronske

State Bar No. 16351640

Melanie P. Goolsby

State Bar No. 24059841

PRONSKE & PATEL, P.C.

2200 Ross Avenue, Suite 5350
Dalias, Texas 75201

(214) 658-6500 - Telephone

(214) 658-6509 — Telecopier

Email: gpronske@pronskepatel.com
Email: mgoolsby@pronskepatel.com

COUNSEL FOR THE PETITIONING CREDITORS

IN THE UNITED DISTRICT COURT
FOR THE NORTHERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS

DALLAS DIVISION
NETSPHERE, INC,, MANILA §
INDUSTRIES, INC., AND MUNISH §
KRISHAN, §
§
Plaintiffs § CIVIL ACTION NO. 3:09-cv-0988-F

§

V. §
§

JEFFREY BARON AND ONDOVA §
LIMITED COMPANY, §
§

Defendants. §

IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
FOR THE NORTHERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS
DALLAS DIVISION

In re: §

§ CASE NO. 12-37921-7

JEFFREY BARON, §
§ INVOLUNTARY CHAPTER 7

Debtor. § PROCEEDING
DECLARATION DESIGNATING SETTLEMENT AUTHORITY
[ hereby state as follows under penalty of perjury pursuant to 28 U.S.C. § 1746:
1 My name is WM I am over the age of eighteen (18) years and am

competent to testify to the matters set forth herein.

DECLARATION DESIGNATING SETTLEMENT AUTHORITY — Page 1 of 2 13-10696.27909
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2 This Declaration is provided pursuant to the Order Directing Mediation
entered in the above-captioned cases.

3 I am a petitioning creditor in the above-captioned involuntary case
(together, the “Petitioning Creditors™).

4 I hereby designate Gerrit Pronske, counsel for the Petitioning Creditors who
will be personally attending the court-ordered mediation in the above-captioned cases, as
my personal representative with full and complete authority to enter into a settlement on
my behalf without the necessity of consulting with me during the mediation.

5 To the best of my knowledge, the information contained herein is true and
accurate.

FURTHER DECLARANT SAYETH NOT.

I declare on April 22, 2013under penalty of perjury that the foregoing is true and

R -
Poawik Rovers Potner
Yodes Tagler (P

correct,

DECLARATION DESIGNATING SETTLEMENT AUTHORITY — Page 2 of 2 13-10696.27910
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U.S. DISTRICT COURT
NORTHERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS

IN THE UNITED STATES DISTRICTICOURT____ FILED

FOR THE NORTHERN DISTRICT Of TEXA
DALLAS DIVISION ] AR 22 201

NETSPHERE, INC., § 2
MANILA INDUSTRIES, INC, AND  § f
MUNISH KRISHAN § . CLERK,US JighicT cotwt

; Devity FBLF -
PLAINTIFFS, §

§
V. §  CIVIL ACTION NO. 3:09-CV-0988-F

§
JEFFREY BARON AND §
ONDOVA LIMITED COMPANY, §

§
DEFENDANTS, §

ORDER DENYING WITHOUT PREJUDICE MOTION FOR DISCOVERY, AND
DENYING MOTIONS FOR CONTINUANCE AND TO RE-CONSIDER FUNDING FOR
JEFFREY BARON’S COUNSEL

BEFORE THE COURT is Jeffrey Baron’s Motion for Discovery, for Continuance and to
Re-Consider Funding for Jeffrey Baron’s Counsel, filed April 19, 2013 (Docket No. 1240). The
Court is of the opinion that the Motion for Discovery should be DENIED WITHOUT
PREJUDICE and the Motions for Continuance and to Re-consider Funding for Jeffrey Baron’s
Counsel should be DENIED.'

I. Motion for Discovery

First, Baron moves the Court to compel discovery from all parties that have submitted fee
requests to the Court. The Court, however, is unable to address the issue of discovery at this
time. Local Rule 7.1 requires attorneys filing non-dispositive motions to confer with all parties to
determine whether the motion is opposed and explain why an agreement could not be reached.

Here, Mr. Cochell’s Certificate of Conference reads: “Defendant Jeffrey Baron presumes

that the Chapter 11 Trustee does not oppose this Motion as he set the deposition of the Receiver,

! This resolves Docket No. 1240.
1
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Peter Vogel, and based on the opposition of the Noticed deposition by Receiver, Baron presumes
counsel for Receiver will oppose this Motion. Therefore, the Motion is submitted to the Court for
consideration.” These presumptions are insufficient to meet the requirements as set forth in the
local rules. It is precisely for these types of disputes that the conference requirement is in place; a
motion to compel discovery should be filed only after the parties have made legitimate attempts
to reach an agreement and then only on those specific matters for which the parties cannot agree.
At this time, given that the parties have not meaningfully discussed discovery, it is premature to
compel it. Therefore, the Motion for Discovery is DENIED WITHOUT PREJUDICE.

The Court adds, to hopefully guide the parties, that the Bankruptcy Court, this Court and
the Fifth Circuit have not found bad faith on the part of any of the Receivership parties. The
Court therefore encourages counsel to avoid over-reliance on arguments which have already
been rejected by various courts and to instead focus on the merits of the fees themselves.

IL. Motion for Continuance

Baron also moves for a continuance to allow more time for his counsel to review the
submitted fee applications on the grounds that there are thousands of entries to review, “inflated,
duplicative or unnecessary” billings by the Receiver, Trustee and their lawyers, and that the time
allotted is not sufficient for Baron’s counsel, both sole practitioners, to review all of the billings.
Although the Court is sympathetic to the amount of work that needs to be done, it is not
convinced that a continuance is necessary.

First, the Court set the deadlines for the fee applications, the objections, the pre-trial
conference and the trial itself in the presence of all parties and with their input. After the Court’s
initial suggestion for deadlines, counsel for the Trustee suggested a longer time frame to allow

for the preparation of complete fee applications and objections; the deadlines were accordingly

2
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adjusted. When the Court addressed Mr. Cochell, he raised no concerns or objections to the
finalized schedule itself and merely expressed concern about obtaining funds from the
Receivership to hire staff to assist on this project (addressed below). To facilitate the expedited
schedule and the physical constraints of Mr. Baron’s attorneys, the Court satisfied Mr. Cochell’s
concerns by allowing for general and not line-by-line objections.

Second, throughout the duration of the Receivership, all parties requesting payment from
its funds have filed applications to the Court. Accompanying these filings are appendices
supporting the requested fees and expenses. Although there will undoubtedly be additional, new
entries for counsel to review in the most recently filed applications, the substance of the earlier
fee requests has been on the record for months; these billings cannot, therefore, be a surprise to
Baron or his counsel. Similarly, the Court informed the parties of its intents with regard to fees in
light of the Fifth Circuit opinion and asked the parties to respond. Now that the Mandate has
issued, the Court can proceed. This issue has been pending for months and much of the
Receiver’s, Trustee’s and their counsel’s billing information has been available for some time.

Finally, all parties are aware that this Court will be leaving the bench at the end of May
and has limited availability to resolve these important issues. Given that the Fifth Circuit directed
this Court, with its particular knowledge of this complicated case, to re-examine the
Receivership fees, it is to the benefit of all involved, including Mr. Baron, to have these matters
resolved promptly and by the Court most familiar with the case. Any additional continuance will
make it impossible for this Court to try this issue; if this Court cannot do so, the resulting delay
that will undoubtedly result if this case is transferred will be a prejudice to all parties.

As to the due process concern raised by Mr. Baron, the Court is not convinced that any

violation has occurred. Baron must be given a meaningful opportunity to be heard in a
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meaningful manner. Williams v. McKeithen, 939 F.2d 1100, 1105 (5th Cir. 1991) (“This notice
requirement, with few exceptions, implies ‘a hearing in which the defendant is given a fair
opportunity to oppose the application and to prepare for such opposition [to the injunction].”)
(quoting Granny Goose Foods, Inc. v. Brotherhood of Teamsters & Auto Truck Drivers Local
No. 70 of Alameda, 415 U.S. 423, 94 S.Ct. 1113, 1121 n. 7, 39 L.Ed.2d 435 (1974)). The Court
has in no way restricted Baron’s ability or authority to object to the fee applications submitted to
the Court. Baron was notified of this issue months in advance, was present when the Court
scheduled deadlines to submit and respond to fee applications and will have a full opportunity to
be heard at the May 8, 2013 trial. The Court acknowledges the difficulties of responding to these
applications in the time period prescribed, but does not think it entirely deficient to allow Baron
to meaningfully prepare for trial.

It is for these reasons that Baron’s Motion for Continuance is DENIED.

III.  Motion to Re-Consider Funding for Baron’s Counsel

Finally, Baron has again renewed his request for attorney’s fees. At the April 4, 2013
Joint Hearing, both Judge Jernigan and this Court explicitly stated, numerous times, that no one
would be paid until a ruling could be made on the involuntary bankruptcy. Nevertheless, the
Court noted Baron’s attorneys were in no way foreclosed from seeking compensation at a later
time: if no order for relief is entered in the involuntary, a wind down of the Receivership will
commence and Mr. Baron’s assets will be returned to him, but if an order for relief is entered
they can seek payment through the bankruptcy process. Furthermore, the Court clarified that Mr.
Cochell and Mr. Wright could have engagement letters with Mr. Baron, but with the

understanding that he did not have assets available at present. The Court reiterates its statements

4
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from the hearing: there will be no favoritism here. No one has been paid in months and no one
will be paid right now.

The Court certainly recognizes that particular challenges faced by solq practitioners in
complex cases such as this one, but cannot be in the position of providing special treatment. The
Court has clearly stated that no professionals will be paid until the Bankruptcy Court issues its
opinion on the involuntary bankruptcy. The Court cannot be in a position of assuring payment to
Baron’s counsel at this time. Both Mr. Cochell and Mr. Wright were aware of the posture and
complexities of this case, as well as their own limitations, when they decided to represent Mr.
Baron. Now that counsel’s right to obtain engagement letters from Mr. Baron has been clarified,
the Court sees no reason to further intervene.

The Court also reminds Baron that not only have the Receiver, the Trustee and their
counsel been working without payment for many months, but that they all stand to lose
recoupment of anticipated fees and expenses in addition to the threat of potential disgorgement.
All parties may expend considerable resources to litigate on the Receivership fees without the
assurance of any repayment.

As to the constitutional issue raised by Mr. Baron in this regard, the Court finds no
infringement of rights. Baron has been afforded a fair opportun